UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.53A 16.04 Fire code

Deleted 16.08 Liability of County

Deleted 16.16 Fire Marshal

Deleted 16.18 Open Fires

30.52A 17.04 Uniform Building Code

30.91U.010 17.04 UBC

30.63B 17.05 Grading code

30.53B 17.06 U Code/abate of dangerous
bldgs

30.52C 17.12 Ventilation and Indoor Air
Quality Code

30.52E 17.16 Uniform Plumbing Code

30.52B 17.18 Uniform Mechanical Code

30.52D 17.22 Energy Code

30.54A 17.28 Mobile home & commercial
coach prmts

30.53C 17.44 Uniform housing code

Deleted 18.11 General

Deleted 18.13 Interpretations

Deleted 18.14 Construction of the Code

30.91L.110 18.32 Locksmith

Deleted 18.41 Access Requirements

Deleted 18.43 Landscaping

Deleted 18.44 Signs

Deleted 18.45 Off-Street Parking

Deleted 18.46 Dev on Steep Slopes

30.42B 18.51 Planned Residential Dev
(PRD)

30.31C 18.52 Landing Field zone

30.31E 18.53 Townhouse(T) zone

1 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.42E 18.55 Mobile home park (MHP) stds
& prmts

30.31F 18.65 RB, RI, and RFS zones

30.34A 18.68 Urban Center Demonstration
Program

5 30.22.020(3) 18.72 Administrative conditional Establishing new permit type for temporary and special uses;

uses formerly controlled by footnotes and chapter 18.72.

Deleted 18.72 Procd f/C,Sp, TUP,Vr, Adm
apl

30.42A 18.73 Rezones

Deleted 18.73 Amendments and rezoning
proced

Deleted 19.04 Purpose

Deleted 19.08 Applicability

30.86.100 19.14 Subdivision fees

Deleted 19.16 Prelim plat submittal & not
proc

Deleted 19.22 Prel. Plat Format & Content

Deleted 19.24 Prel. Plat - Public Welfare

Deleted 19.28 Subdiv. Standards Cap. of
Mod.

Deleted 19.32 Subdiv. Const. Requir.

Deleted 19.36 Modifications

Deleted 19.42 Model Homes

Deleted 19.44 Replats

Deleted 19.56 Land Use Enforcement

Deleted 19.58 Miscellaneous

Deleted 20 Short Subdivision Code

Deleted 20.04 Purpose

Deleted 20.08 Definitions

2 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 20.12 Scope
Deleted 20.24 Short Plat Applic regs
Deleted 20.26 Final Short Plat
Deleted 20.28 Minimum Qual. & Improv.
Stds.
Deleted 20.32 Modifications
Deleted 20.36 Review and Penalties
Deleted 20.45 Conver. of Pending and

Approv. Prel. Short Plats to
Rural Cluster Short Subd App.

Deleted 21.04 Preliminary

Deleted 21.08 Definitions

Deleted 21.12 Applicability

Deleted 21.16 Part 2-Permit administration

Deleted 21.24 Part 4-Enforcement

Deleted 21.28 Severability

Deleted 23.08 Definitions

Deleted 23.24 Lead Department

Deleted 23.28 Part 7-Pub Notice &
Comment

Deleted 23.32 Part 8: -Environmental Impact
Statement (EIS) process

Deleted 23.36 Substantive Authority

Deleted 23.44 Forms

30.63A 24 Drainage

30.43C 27.16 Flood hazard permits

30.43D 27.44 Flood hazard area variances

30.85.130 28.12 Notice and order

30.32A 32.13 Forest Lands

3 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.32C 32.16 Mineral Resource Lands
30.33B 32.35 Growth Phasing Overlay
30.91R.220 13.02.350, Road or public road

19A.20.240,
26B.51.098

Deleted 13.130.030 Order to cease violation

Deleted 13.130.040 Notice of violation

Deleted 13.130.050 Public nuisance

Deleted 13.130.060 Alternative remedies.

Deleted 13.130.070 Administrative jurisdiction

30.76.010 14.01.010 Purpose and applicability

30.91D.080 14.01.020(1) Deferred interest loan

Deleted 14.01.020(2) Director

30.91D.290 14.01.020(3) Displaced mobile home
owner

30.91E.090 14.01.020(4) Eligible applicant

30.91F.310 14.01.020(5) First-time home buyer

30.91N.090 14.01.020(7) Nonprofit housing
organization

Deleted 14.01.020(8) Public housing authority

30.76.020 14.01.030 Projects eligible for PPP

30.76.030 14.01.040 Permits subject to priority
permit processing

30.76.040 14.01.050 Application for certificate of
eligiblity

30.76.050 14.01.060 Low-income hsng preserv
agrmt

30.76.060 14.01.070 Priority permit processing
procedure

Deleted 16 Fire code

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.53A.010 16.04.010 UFC '97-Ed. Vol.1 & 2
30.53A.025 16.04.030 Subsec 103.2.1.2 delete/new
add

30.53A.040 16.04.035 Subsec 103.2.2.1 deleted

30.53A.050 16.04.045 Subsec 103.2.2.2 delete/new
add

30.53A.060 16.04.060 Subsec 103.3.1.1 delete/new
add

30.53A.070 16.04.070 Inspection Fee

30.53A.080 16.04.080 Subsec 103.1.4 delete/new
add

30.53A.090 16.04.085 Subsec 104.2 delete/new add

30.53A.100 16.04.095 Section 204 amended

Deleted 16.04.095 Sec 204 amended

30.91C.070 16.04.095(1) Chief

Deleted 16.04.095(2) Chief engineer

30.91C.080 16.04.095(3) Chief of police or police dept.

30.91C.160 16.04.095(4) Commercial occupancy

30.53A.110 16.04.100 Section 207 amended

Deleted 16.04.100 Sec 207 amended

30.91F.300 16.04.100(2) Fire lane(Fire apparatus a. rd)

30.91F.240 16.04.100(2) Fire department

30.53A.115 16.04.101 Section 221 amended

30.91T.030 16.04.101 Sec 221 amended-Temporary
Membrane Structure

30.91T.130 16.04.101 Sec 221 amended-
Turnaround

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.53A.120 16.04.105 Section 222 amended
Deleted 16.04.105 Sec 222 amended-Def of
“yL”

30.53A.130 16.04.120 Fire plan review & permit fee

30.53A.140 16.04.135 Subsec 1 deleted/new add

30.53A.150 16.04.137 Sec 902.2 - 902.4.1 added

30.53A.160 16.04.155 Subsec .1 deleted; new add

30.53A.170 16.04.165 Subsec 1007.1.6 added

30.53A.180 16.04.185 Sec 903 deleted

30.53A.190 16.04.240 Subsec 1007.1.4.1 added

30.53A.200 16.04.250 Sec 1007.2.9.3.1-3.9 added

30.53A.210 16.04.260 Subsec 7902.1.7.2.4 amend

30.53A.220 16.04.270 Subsec 1003.2.3.3
delete/new...

30.53A.230 16.04.272 Subsec 10003.2.4.1
delete/new...

30.53A.235 16.04.274 Subsec 1003.2.5.1
delete/new...

30.53A.240 16.04.276 Subsec 1003.2.6.1
delete/new...

30.53A.250 16.04.278 Subsec 1003.2.8 deleted/new
add

30.53A.260 16.04.280 Subsec 1003.2.9 deleted/new
add

30.53A.270 16.04.282 Group S occupancies

30.53A.280 16.04.284 Use of area separation
walls...

Deleted 16.08.010 Liability of county officials

Deleted 16.10 Fireworks Permit Code

1 [30.53A.400 16.10.020 Fireworks Para. 1 new - explanatory statement; re: fireworks permits.

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.53A.410 16.10.030 Permit req'd
30.53A.420 16.10.040 Fireworks permit-application
30.53A.430 16.10.060 Firewrks permit grant/denial
30.85.117 16.10.070, Revocation
17.28.065,
28.16.020
5 30.53A.440 16.10.080 Appeals Permit appeal process changed from enforcement hearing to
regular Type 1 permit appeal.
30.53A.450 16.10.090 Ret offirewrks-sales locations
30.53A.460 16.10.100 Retailers of fireworks
30.53A.470 16.10.110 Ret o/firewrks-signs/close/ext
30.53A.475 16.10.120 Unlawful storage
30.53A.480 16.10.130 Unlawful possess/discharge
30.53A.485 16.10.140 Public display-general
30.53A.490 16.10.150 Pub displa+D698y-disposal
of unfired
30.53A.495 16.10.160 Com firewrks-ret/discharge
30.53A.487 16.10.170 Violations - Misdemeanors
Deleted 16.10.180 Severability
30.53A.020 16.16.010 Fire marshal
16.16.020
16.16.030
16.16.040
30.53A.500 16.18.010 Open fires prohib @ county
landfills
Deleted 16.36.010 Purpose
1 30.53A.380 16.36.020 Definitions specific to this Added definition for UFC and water main.
chapter
Deleted 16.36.020 Definitions specific to this

chap

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91F.250 16.36.020(1) Fire department or fire district
30.91U.020 16.36.020(10) UFC
30.91W.010 16.36.020(11) Water main
30.91F.190 16.36.020(2) FDC
30.91F.260 16.36.020(3) Fire flow
30.91F.270 16.36.020(4) Fire hydrant
30.91F.280 16.36.020(5) Fire hydrant, private
30.91F.290 16.36.020(6) Fire hydrant, public
30.91P.410 16.36.020(7) Public water system
30.91W.020 16.36.020(8) Water purveyor
30.91R.260 16.36.020(9), Rural area

26B.51.110
30.53A.300 16.36.030 Water mains and fire hydrants
16.36.060
30.53A.310 16.36.040 Req'd witr supply f/fire protect
30.53A.315 16.36.050 Exemptions
30.53A.320 16.36.070 Fire hydrant spacing
30.53A.330 16.36.080 Fire hydr install/maint regs
30.53A.340 16.36.090 Water main specs
30.53A.350 16.36.100 Procedures for compliance
30.53A.360 16.36.110 Fire dept notification
30.53A.370 16.36.120 Water purveyor authority
Deleted 16.40 Enforcement
30.53A.600 16.40.010 Enforcement: director's
authority
Deleted 16.40.020 Title 28SCC-Applicable
Deleted 16.40.030 Order to cease violation
Deleted 16.40.040 Notice o/viol-penalty/abate
Deleted 16.40.050 Public nuisance

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 16.40.060 Alternative remedies
Deleted 16.40.070 Admin jurisdic nonexclusive
Deleted 16.50 Construction
Deleted 16.50.020 Responsibility of

app/disclaimer
Deleted 16.50.030 No additional county duty
Deleted 16.50.030 No additional county duty
30.86.400 17.02. Uniform building code fees
Deleted 17.02.010 Purpose
30.86.010 17.02.010, Fees established
17.05.170,
24.20.075
30.50.090 17.02.015 Commercial and residential
occupancies defined
Deleted 17.02.019 Com bldg prmt sub reqgs
30.86.450 17.02.090 Signs
30.86.420 17.02.120 Plumbing permit fees
30.86.410 17.02.130 Mechanical permit fees
30.86.430 17.02.140 Fire code fees
17.02.150
30.86.440 17.02.160 Mobil home/comm coach fees
17.28.050
30.52A.010 17.04.010 UBC (97) Vols 1, 2, 3
adopted
30.50.080 17.04.035 Resource lands
30.52A.020 17.04.050 Bldg. permit appl. req. info.
30.52A.030 17.04.060 Subsec 3404 new add mvd
bldgs
30.52A.040 17.04.070 Subsec 105.3 added

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.52A.050 17.04.080 Paragraph added to Sec 103-
violations/penalties
30.52A.060 17.04.090 Subsec 106.1 para added
30.91M.150 17.04.090(2)(a) |Mobile home
30.91C.140 17.04.090(2)(b) |Commercial coach
30.91F.060 17.04.090(2)(c) |Factory-built structure
30.52A.070 17.04.110 Subsec 106.2 amended -
work exempt from permit
30.91T.020 17.04.110(1)(m) |Temporary growing structure
30.52A.080 17.04.125 Permit processing & notice
Deleted 17.04.127 Consistency determin
30.52A.090 17.04.130 Subsec 106.4.1 new para
added
30.52A.100 17.04.132 Subsec 106.4.1 amended
30.52A.110 17.04.140 Subsec 106.4.4
amended/Expirations
1 [30.52A.120 17.04.150 Sec 107 fees amended Moved to chapter 30.86 SCC.
Deleted 17.04.150(2-3) Sec 107 amended —fees
30.52A.130 17.04.180 Subsec 109.1 Added requirement to comply with short subdivision conditions;
1 amend/Occupancy added reference to "no final* CO until conditions met: allows
temp. CO.
1 30.52A.140 17.04.188 Subsec 108.5.6 amend/req |Added requirement to comply with short subdivision conditions.
inspec
30.52A.150 17.04.200 Sec 220 def amend/Story
30.91S.630 17.04.200, Story
18.90.805
30.52A.160 17.04.202 Subsec 904.2.3.3
deleted/new...
30.52A.170 17.04.204 Subsec 904.2.4.1
deleted/new...

10

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.52A.180 17.04.206 Subsec 904.2.5.1
deleted/new...

30.52A.190 17.04.208 Subsec 904.2.6.1
deleted/new...

30.52A.200 17.04.210 Sec 904.2.8 deleted/new...

30.52A.210 17.04.212 Sec 904.2.9 deleted/new...

30.52A.220 17.04.214 Group S occupancies

30.52A.230 17.04.216 Use of area separation
walls...

30.52A.300 17.04.260 Subsec 1804.7 amended-
drain

30.63B.010 17.05.010, Purpose and applicability

17.05.015

Deleted 17.05.015 Applicability

30.63B.020 17.05.020 Exemptions

Deleted 17.05.025 Director of PDS authority

30.63B.030 17.05.030 Requirements for PW
contracts

30.63B.040 17.05.035 Compliance w/ other laws

30.63B.050 17.05.040 Relationship to other env regs

Deleted 17.05.040(3) Relationship to Sno.Co.
environmental policy Title 23

30.63B.060 17.05.045 Person responsible

17.05.115

Deleted 17.05.045(1) Liability

Deleted 17.05.110 Grading permit required

30.63B.070 17.05.120 Submittal requirements

30.63B.080 17.05.125 Notice of application

11

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 17.05.125 Notice of application-grad in
excess of 500 cy
Deleted 17.05.125 Notice of application-grad in
excess of 500 cy
1 [30.63B.100 17.05.130 Engineered grading Signature of civil engineer required with stamp.
30.63B.110 17.05.135 Reports on geotechnical...
30.63B.240 17.05.140 Bonds or performance
security
Deleted 17.05.140 Bonds
30.63B.200 17.05.145 Issuance of grading permits
30.63B.210 17.05.150 Grading permit expiration &
renewal
30.63B.220 17.05.155 Grading inspection Subsection (4) was omitted when the revised Drainage ord was
1 adopted in 1998. Added back in to describe the role of
engineering geologist.
30.63B.230 17.05.160 Completion of work
30.63B.300 17.05.165 Hazards
30.86.520 17.05.170 Grading permit fees
Deleted 17.05.170 Grading permit fees
30.63B.310 17.05.210 Cuts or excavations
30.63B.320 17.05.215 Fills or embankments
1 |30.63B.330 17.05.220 Setbacks for cuts or fills Figure on set back dimensions deleted.
30.63B.340 17.05.225 Drainage and terracing
30.63B.350 17.05.230 Erosion control
30.63B.360 17.05.235 Reclam. of quarry/mining.
sites.
30.63B.250 17.05.240 Modifications of permit condit
Deleted 17.05.310 Defins spec. to this chapter
Deleted 17.05.310(11) Director
30.91E.020 17.05.310(12) Earth material

12

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91E.110 17.05.310(14) Engineering geologist
30.91E.120 17.05.310(15) Engineering geology
30.91E.220 17.05.310(17) Excavation
30.91F.210 17.05.310(18) Fill
30.91G.040 17.05.310(19), Geotechnical engineer

24.70.155,
32.10.110(20)
Deleted 17.05.310(20) Grade
Deleted 17.05.310(21) Grading
30.91K.040 17.05.310(22) Key
30.91M.010 17.05.310(23), Maintenance
24.70.190
Deleted 17.05.310(24) Owner
30.91P.330 17.05.310(25) Professional inspection
Deleted 17.05.310(26) Site
30.91S.370 17.05.310(27), Site review
24.70.265
30.91S.380 17.05.310(28), Slope
32.10.110(38)
30.91S.460 17.05.310(29) Saoil
30.91A.300 17.05.310(3) As-graded
30.91S.470 17.05.310(30) Soils engineer
30.91S.480 17.05.310(31) Soils engineering
30.91S.540 17.05.310(32), Specifications
24.70.285
30.91T.050 17.05.310(33) Terrace
30.91B.060 17.05.310(4) Bedrock
30.91B.070 17.05.310(5) Bench
30.91C.090 17.05.310(6) Civil engineer
30.91C.100 17.05.310(7) Civil engineering

13

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91C.210 17.05.310(8) Compaction

Deleted 17.05.310(9) Critical areas

30.53B.010 17.06.010 UC/abate of dngrs
bldgs..1997 Ed. adopted

30.53B.020 17.06.050 Sec 203 para added-Vio &
penalties

30.53B.025 17.06.060 Appeals

30.53B.030 17.06.065 Notice & Order

30.53B.040 17.06.075 Repair/vac/demo

30.53B.050 17.06.085 Posting

30.53B.060 17.06.095 Compliance

30.52C.010 17.12.010 Code adopted

30.52C.020 17.12.020 Violations and penalties

Deleted 17.12.090 Appeals

30.52E.010 17.16.010 UPC adopted

30.52E.020 17.16.030 Permit exemptions

30.52E.030 17.16.040 Sec 102.3 deleted/new sec
added

30.52E.045 17.16.045 Permit Expiration

30.52E.050 17.16.050 Secl03.4 Fees

30.52E.060 17.16.070 Board of Appeals

30.52E.040 17.16.080 Permits

30.52B.010 17.18.010 UMC adopted

30.52B.020 17.18.040 Sec 110 amended

30.52B.030 17.18.050 Sec 111 amend.-Viol. &
Penal.

30.52B.040 17.18.055 Sec 114.4.1 amended/Expire

30.52B.050 17.18.060 Sec 115 & 116/Permit fees

30.54B 17.20 Uniform sign code

30.54B.010 17.20.010 Code adopted

14

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.54B.020 17.20.050 Permit required
30.54B.030 17.20.070 Sec 303 amended
30.54B.035 17.20.090 Appeals
Deleted 17.20.090 Appeals
30.54B.040 17.20.110 Political signs
30.54B.060 17.20.120 Violations and penalties
30.52D.010 17.22.010 Code adopted
30.52D.020 17.22.020 Violations and penalties
Deleted 17.22.090 Appeals
30.54A.010 17.28.010 Code adopted
30.54A.020 17.28.030 Mobile home permit
30.54A.030 17.28.040 Administration
30.54A.040 17.28.045 Flood hazard zone
Deleted 17.28.050 Permit fees
30.54A.050 17.28.060 Inspection approval
30.54A.060 17.28.070 Violations and Penalties
30.53C.010 17.44.010 UHC adopted
30.53C.020 17.44.020 Words/phrases changed
30.53C.030 17.44.030 Sec 103, 3rd para, amnd
30.53C.035 17.44.040 Section 203, new sentence
added

Deleted 17.44.040 Sec 203 new sentence added

30.53C.040 17.44.050 Sec 204 amended-Vio &
penalties

30.50.020 17.50.010 Board of appeals

30.50.030 17.50.020 Appt, terms & # of board
positions

30.50.050 17.50.030 Board authority

17.50.040

15

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.50.040 17.50.040 Appeal procedure
30.50.060 17.50.060 Building official and fire
marshal
Deleted 17.60.020 Title 28 SCC applicable
Deleted 17.60.030 Order to cease violation
Deleted 17.60.040 Notice of viol/penalty/abate
30.50.070 17.60.045 Enforcement-immediate
hazards
Deleted 17.60.060 alternative remedies
Deleted 17.60.070 Admin jurisd-nonexclusive
30.81.020 17.90, 18.11 Oblig of prop
own/occup/applic
30.81.030 17.90,18.11 County liability
Deleted 17.90.010 Severability
Deleted 17.90.020 Responsibility of
app/disclaimer
Deleted 17.90.030 No additional county duty
1 30.21.010 18.11.010; Purpose and applicability Combines existing chapters 18.11 & 18.12 SCC. Zoning and
18.11.030 development standards: purpose and establishment of zones.
Deleted 18.11.020 Name
30.91N.030 18.11.035 Natural resource lands
Deleted 18.11.035 Nat. res. lands
30.10.035 18.11.040 Benefits
Deleted 18.11.040 Benefits
Deleted 18.11.050 County liability
Deleted 18.11.050 Limitations
Deleted 18.11.060 Severability
Deleted 18.12.010 Conf to state statutes
1 30.21.025 18.12.030 Intent of zones Describes intent of Urban, Rural, Resource and Other zones;

including those formerly not described.

16

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.21.025(1)

18.12.030(1)

Urban zones

30.21.025(1)(a)

18.12.030(1)

Single family residential

30.21.025(4)(e)

18.12.030(1)(d)

Residential 12,500 sq. ft. (R-

Moved from residential to "Other Zones"

1 12,500)
1 30.21.025(4)(d) (18.12.030(1)(e) |Residential 20,000 sqg. ft. (R- |Moved from residential to "Other Zones"
20,000)
1 [30.21.025(4)(f) [18.12.030(1)() Waterfront beach (WFB) Moved from residential to "Other Zones"
30.21.025(1)(b) [18.12.030(2) Multiple Family Residential
1 30.21.025(4)(a) (18.12.030(3)(a) |Suburban Agriculturel Acre |Classified under "Other Zones" rather than "Rural Zone"
(SA-1)
1 [30.21.025(4)(b) [18.12.030(3)(c) |Rural Conservation (RC) RC moved to the category of Other Zones.
30.21.025(2) 18.12.030(3),(5), |Rural Zones
(6)
30.21.025(3) 18.12.030(4) Resource Zones
30.21.025(1)(c) [18.12.030(5) Commercial
30.21.025(1)(d) |[18.12.030(6)(a- |Industrial Zones
c).(5)(®
1 [30.21.025(4)(c) [18.12.030(7) Rural Use (RU) Was it's own classification - moved to "Other Zones"
30.21.030 18.12.040, .050, |(Zoning maps & boundaries
.060, .070
30.21.040 18.12.080 Flood hazard & noise impact
areas
30.10.040 18.13.020 Compliance w/other laws
30.22.010 18.32.010 Purpose and applicability Uses allowed in zones
30.22.020 18.32.020 Categories of uses
30.22.020(1) 18.32.020(1) Permitted uses (P)
30.22.020(2) 18.32.020(2) Conditional uses (C)
1 30.22.050 18.32.020(3); Temporary emergency use or |Formerly allowed through footnotes to use matrix.

18.32.040(B)(20)

structure

30.22.020(4)

18.32.020(4)

Prohibited uses

17

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.22.025 18.32.020(5) Incidental uses
30.22.030 18.32.030 Number of uses per lot
1 30.22.100 18.32.040(A) Urban Zones Travel Trailer Court removed and replaced with Reference 42
"Recreational Vehicle Park"; "Club" changed to "Clubhouse".
30.22.100; 18.32.040(A) Use Matrix Restructured matrix; now grouped by category of zone: urban,
1 [30.22.110; rural, resource, and other.
30.22.120
1 30.22.110 18.32.040(A) Rural and Resource Zones Added "Recreational Vehicle Park; Travel Trailer Court
removed; reference to SF dwelling removed from RB.
30.22.120 18.32.040(A) Other Zones
1 [30.22.130(83) 18.32.040(A) Manufacturing, Heavy Identifying heavy manufacturing uses.

30.22.130(84)

18.32.040(A)(gen
erally)

All other forms of
manufacture...

Identifying other manufacturing uses.

30.22.130

18.32.040(B)

Reference Notes for Use
Matrix

30.22.130(1)

18.32.040(B)(1)

Airport, Stage 1 Utility

30.22.130(10)

18.32.040(B)(10)

Farm worker dwelling

30.22.130(11)

18.32.040(B)(11)

Home occupation - general

30.28.050

18.32.040(B)(11):
(68) & (86)

Home Occupation

30.22.130(12)

18.32.040(B)(12)

Kennel, commercial

30.22.130(13)

18.32.040(B)(13)

Kennel, private-
breeding/private-non-
breeding

30.22.130(14)

18.32.040(B)(14)

Parks, publicly owned &

operated
30.22.130(15) 18.32.040(B)(15) |Boarding house
Deleted 18.32.040(B)(16) |Deleted

30.22.130(16)

18.32.040(B)(17)

Social service center

30.22.130(17)

18.32.040(B)(18)

Swimming/wading pool

18

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.22.130(18)

18.32.040(B)(19)

Temporary dwelling for a
relative

30.22.130(2)

18.32.040(B)(2)

Day Care Center

30.22.130(19)

18.32.040(B)(21)

Travel trailer

30.22.130(20)

18.32.040(B)(22)

Ultralight airpark

30.22.130(21)

18.32.040(B)(23)

Craft shop

30.22.130(22)

18.32.040(B)(24)

Grocery and drug stores

30.22.130(23)

18.32.040(B)(25)

Motor vehicle and equipment
sales

30.22.130(24)

18.32.040(B)(26)

Race track

30.22.130(25)

18.32.040(B)(27)

Rural industry

30.22.130(26)

18.32.040(B)(28)

Sawmill, Shake & Shingle Mill

30.22.130(27)

18.32.040(B)(29)

Govt and Utility structures and
facilities

30.22.130(3)

18.32.040(B)(3)

Dock & Boathouse - Private,
noncommercial

30.22.130(28)

18.32.040(B)(30)

Excavation & processing of
minerals

30.28.035

18.32.040(B)(30)

Excavation and processing of
minerals

30.22.130(29)

18.32.040(B)(31)

Medical clinic, hospital,
licensed practitioners,
hotel/motel

30.22.130(30)

18.32.040(B)(32)

Forest Industry Storage &
Maintnc Facility

30.22.130(31)

18.32.040(B)(33)

Boat launch facilities -
commcl. & non-commcl.

30.22.130(32)

18.32.040(B)(34)

Campground

19

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.22.130(33)

18.32.040(B)(35)

Commercial vehicle home
basing

30.22.130(34)

18.32.040(B)(36)

Distillation of alcohol

30.22.130(35)

18.32.040(B)(37)

Group care facility

30.22.130(36)

18.32.040(B)(38)

Mobile home & travel trailer
sales

30.22.130(37)

18.32.040(B)(39)

Farm product processing

30.22.130(4)

18.32.040(B)(4)

Dwelling, SFD in PCB

30.22.130(38)

18.32.040(B)(40)

Small animal husbandry

30.22.130(39)

18.32.040(B)(41)

Mobile Home Park

30.22.130(40)

18.32.040(B)(42)

Sludge utilization

30.28.085 18.32.040(B)(42) |Sludge utilization
30.22.130(41) 18.32.040(B)(43) |Homestead parcel
30.28.055 18.32.040(B)(43) |Homestead parcels

30.22.130(42)

18.32.040(B)(44)

Special setback regs

30.22.130(43)

18.32.040(B)(45)

Min lot size-duplexes

30.22.130(44)

18.32.040(B)(46)

Petrol products & gas - bulk
storage

30.22.130(45)

18.32.040(B)(47)

Auto wrecking yards &

junkyards
30.22.130(46) 18.32.040(B)(48) |Antique shops
30.22.130(47) 18.32.040(B)(49) |Billboards

30.22.130(5)

18.32.040(B)(5)

Dwelling, Townhouse

30.22.130(48)

18.32.040(B)(50)

Nursery, wholesale

30.22.130(49)

18.32.040(B)(51)

Stockyard/livestock auction
facility

30.22.130(50)

18.32.040(B)(52)

Restaurants/personal service
shops

30.22.130(51)

18.32.040(B)(53)

Sludge utilization

30.22.130(52)

18.32.040(B)(54)

Single family dwellings

20

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.22.130(53)

18.32.040(B)(55)

Greenhouses, lath houses &
nurseries

30.22.130(54)

18.32.040(B)(56)

Retail stores in BP zone

30.22.130(55)

18.32.040(B)(58)

Retail sales of hay, grain...

30.22.130(56)

18.32.040(B)(59)

Noise of machines...

30.22.130(6)

18.32.040(B)(6)

Dwelling, Mobile Home

30.22.130(57)

18.32.040(B)(60)

Sludge utilization

30.22.130(58)

18.32.040(B)(61)

Woodwaste recycling...

30.28.095

18.32.040(B)(61)

Woodwaste recycling and
woodwaste storage facility

30.22.130(59)

18.32.040(B)(62)

B & B guesthouses and B & B
inns

30.28.020

18.32.040(B)(62)

Bed and breakfast
guesthouses and bed and
breakfast inns

30.22.130(60)

18.32.040(B)(63)

Storage structure over...

30.22.130(61)

18.32.040(B)(64)

Storage structures over 1,000
sq.ft. in R-7200 & R-8400

30.22.130(62) 18.32.040(B)(65) [Museums

30.22.130(63) 18.32.040(B)(66) |Accessory apts

30.28.010 18.32.040(B)(66) |Accessory apartments
30.22.130(64) 18.32.040(B)(67) | Temp woodwaste recycling...
30.28.090 18.32.040(B)(67) | Temporary woodwaste

recycling and temporary
woodwaste storage facilities

30.22.130(65)

18.32.040(B)(68)

Home occupations - use of
accessory buildings

30.22.130(66)

18.32.040(B)(69)

On-site haz waste treatment...

21

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.22.130(7)

18.32.040(B)(7)

Fallout shelter, joint

30.22.130(67)

18.32.040(B)(70)

CU-Offsite haz waste
treatment...

30.22.130(68)

18.32.040(B)(71)

Adult Entertainment uses

30.28.015

18.32.040(B)(71)

Adult entertainment uses

30.22.130(69)

18.32.040(B)(72)

Special building height

30.22.130(70)

18.32.040(B)(73)

Bakery

30.22.130(71)

18.32.040(B)(74)

Equestrian ctrs

30.22.130(72)

18.32.040(B)(75)

Mini-equestrian ctrs

30.22.130(73)

18.32.040(B)(76)

Equestrian center and mini-
equestrian centers

30.22.130(74)

18.32.040(B)(77)

Temp Res Sales Coach

30.22.130(75)

18.32.040(B)(78)

Golf course and driving range

30.22.130(76)

18.32.040(B)(79)

Model hobby park

30.28.060

18.32.040(B)(79)

Model hobby park

30.22.130(8)

18.32.040(B)(8)

Family day care home

30.22.130(77)

18.32.040(B)(80)

Commercial retail uses...

30.22.130(78)  |18.32.040(B)(81) |Studio

30.22.130(79) |18.32.040(B)(82) |GFA...1,000
30.22.130(80)  |18.32.040(B)(83) |GFA...2,000
30.22.130(81) |18.32.040(B)(84) |GFA...4,000

30.22.130(82)

18.32.040(B)(85)

Construction contracting...RB
zone

30.22.130(85)

18.32.040(B)(86)

Home occupations -
Resource-based and rural

30.22.130(86)

18.32.040(B)(87)

SF guesthouse

30.22.130(87)

18.32.040(B)(88)

Outdoor storage-CB zone

30.22.130(88)

18.32.040(B)(89)

Wedding Facility

30.22.130(9)

18.32.040(B)(9)

Farm stand

22

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.22.040 18.32.040; Interpretation of matrices
18.14.020;
18.14.030
30.22.140 18.32.050 Moratorium on certain uses.
30.24.050 18.41.010(1) & [Minimum access regs -
(2) certain pre-existing lots
30.24.052 18.41.010(3) Minimum access reqgs. -
general
30.24.055 18.41.010(4) Access across railroad right-
of-way or county-owned trail
30.24.057 18.41.010(5) Alternative access for lots
created by binding site plan
30.24.060 18.41.010(6) Alternative access for lots
created by short subdivision
1 [30.24.025 18.41.020 Min pedestrian access Reference to UBC “Accessibility” added.
30.23.010(1) & |18.42.010(1) & |Dimensional requirements Bulk regulations
(2) (2)
30.23.060 18.42.015 BSP
30.23.030 18.42.020(A) Bulk matrix
30.23.040 18.42.020(B) Ref. notes for Bulk Matrix
1 30.23.040(1) 18.42.020(B)(1) MR bulk requirements - notes |Reference to LDMR standards deleted; unnecessary because

note only applies in urban zones.

30.23.040(10)

18.42.020(B)(10)

Public ROW under 60’

30.23.040(11)

18.42.020(B)(11)

Setbacks measured from
property line

30.23.040(12)

18.42.020(B)(12)

Setbacks measured from
OHWM

30.23.040(13)

18.42.020(B)(13)

Listed setbacks-adjacent
prop F

23

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.23.040(14)

18.42.020(B)(14)

Listed setbacks-SF detached

30.23.040(15)

18.42.020(B)(15)

MR/LDMR setbacks

30.23.040(16)

18.42.020(B)(16)

FS zone setbacks

30.23.040(17)

18.42.020(B)(17)

IP zone setback

30.23.040(18)

18.42.020(B)(18)

PCB zone

30.23.040(19)

18.42.020(B)(19)

PCB/BP zone min tract area

30.23.040(2)

18.42.020(B)(2)

Minimum lot area

30.23.040(20)

18.42.020(B)(21)

Additional setbacks-desig
farmlands

30.23.040(21)

18.42.020(B)(22)

Additional setbacks-forest
lands...

30.23.040(22)

18.42.020(B)(23)

Min lot size-RR-10(RT) desig

30.23.040(23)

18.42.020(B)(24)

Min lot area modified

30.23.040(24)

18.42.020(B)(25)

RCS-Min lot area

30.23.040(25)

18.42.020(B)(26)

Setback measured from ROW
edge

30.23.040(26)

18.42.020(B)(27)

Except where prohibited by
HE

30.23.040(37)

18.42.020(B)(28)

Agriculture-structures for
housing animals. . .

30.23.040(38)

18.42.020(B)(29)

Subdiv of land desig
commercial forest

30.23.040(3)

18.42.020(B)(3)

Minimum lot area

30.23.040(39)

18.42.020(B)(30)

Desig commerc forest-min
500’ stbk

30.23.040(40)

18.42.020(B)(31)

Subdiv of land desig local
forest

30.23.040(41)

18.42.020(B)(32)

Subdiv of land desig upland
commcl. frmind

24

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.23.040(42) 18.42.020(B)(33) |Subdiv of land desig local

comm frml

30.23.040(4) 18.42.020(B)(4) |LDMR-Max density
30.23.040(5) 18.42.020(B)(5) |MR-Max density
30.23.040(6) 18.42.020(B)(6) |Commercial forestry
structures
30.23.040(7) 18.42.020(B)(7) |Non-residential structures
30.23.040(8) 18.42.020(B)(8) |Lot coverage
30.23.040(9) 18.42.020(B)(9) |Public ROWSs 60’ and wider
30.23.050 18.42.030 Height limit exceptions
30.23.240 18.42.045 Resident use of substd lots
30.23.200 18.42.050 Reductions to lot area
30.23.230 18.42.060; Lot area/land taken for public
18.42.070 use
30.23.220 18.42.075 RC minimum lot area
30.23.210 18.42.080 Lot size averaging
30.23.020 18.42.085 Min net density for resid dev in

UGAs

30.23.100(1)-(3) [18.42.090(1)-(3) |Setbacks & sight triangles Section (4) on structures w/in BSP deleted to resolve
1 inconsistency with BSP regulations and hearing examiner
decision; figure added for illustrative purposes.
1 30.23.250 18.42.090; 18.90 |Lot Aggregation Clarifying current practice for when lots must be considered to
have been combined.
30.23.110 18.42.100 Special setbacks for certain  |Sections (1)-(25) renumbered to put in alphabetical order; (2)
2 uses language added to clarify measuring for setbacks when near
park, playground, preschool or K-12 schools.
5 30.23.115 18.42.110 Setback exceptions for minor |Added a limitation of 20% of wall length to define "minor".
architetural features
30.23.125 18.42.120 Setback except. from alleys
1 130.28.040 18.42.130 Fences & free standing walls | Clarified measurement for fences on hills or on retaining walls.

25

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.23.120 18.42.140 Front setback exceptions
30.23.040(43) 18.42.150 RU zone-min lot area
30.25.010 18.43.010 Purpose and Applicability Landscaping
30.25.015 18.43.015 General landscaping
requirements.
30.91D.010 18.43.015(5)(f) |DBH (diameter at breast
height)
30.25.017 18.43.017 Type A & B landscaping
1 30.25.020 18.43.020 Perimeter landscaping regs. |Change "MF development" to "MF structure"; clarifying that SF
detached structures need not provide landscaping buffer.
30.25.022 18.43.022 Parking lot landscaping
30.25.023 18.43.023 Detention facility landscaping
30.25.024 18.43.024 Outside storage and waste
areas
30.25.030 18.43.026 Addlt. landscaping reqts for
PCB, BP and IP zones
30.25.032 18.43.028 Addtl. landscaping reqts. for
RB, RFS & RI zones
30.25.035 18.43.029 Landscaping regs. for BSP
develpmts.
30.25.040 18.43.031 Landscaping modifications
30.25.043 18.43.041 Landscaping installation
30.25.045 18.43.043 Landscaping maintenance
30.25.050 18.43.046 Auto wrecking yards and
junkyards
30.25.060 18.43.095 Landscape plan review and
inspection fee
30.27.010 18.44.010 Signs: general requirements | Signs
30.27.020 18.44.020 Signs: single family

residences

26

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.27.030 18.44.025 Signs: BSP sites
30.27.035 18.44.030 Signs: LDMR and MR zones
30.27.040 18.44.040 Signs: NB,CB,GC,LI,HI, RB

and RI zones
30.27.045 18.44.050 Signs: PCB, BP, IP zones
30.27.050 18.44.060 Signs: FS and RFS zone

reqs
30.27.060 18.44.070 Signs for particular uses
30.27.070 18.44.080 Political signs

1 |30.27.080 18.44.090 Billboards Adding cross reference to new illustrations.

30.26.010 18.45.010 Applicability Parking
30.24.020 18.45.020 Vehicular ingress & egress
30.26.015 18.45.020 Maneuvering and queuing
30.26.020 18.45.030 Location of parking spaces
30.26.025 18.45.030 Tandem parking
30.26.030 18.45.040 Number of spaces required
30.26.035 18.45.050 Parking for unspecified and

unlisted uses
30.26.040 18.45.055 Reduction of req'd. spaces
30.26.045 18.45.060 Mixed occupancies
30.26.050 18.45.070 Joint uses
30.26.055 18.45.080 Cond for joint use
30.26.060 18.45.090 Loading space
30.26.065 18.45.100 Parking lot develop stds
30.26.070 18.45.110 Parking lot surfacing regrmts.
30.26.075 18.45.120 lllumination
30.26.080 18.45.130 Lndscp regs for regulated

prkg areas
30.26.085 18.45.140 Access prkg f/persons w/

disabil.

27

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 30.28.030 18.46.020 Development on steep slopes | Deleted non-substantive sections on intent and accountability.
5 30.41B.210 18.46.030 Design stds-slopes Added PRD exception, so density not limited on PRDs with
slopes
5 30.41A.250 18.46.030, Density for sloping land Added PRD exception, so density not limited on PRDs with
19.28.050 slopes
30.34B 18.50 Reduced drainage discharge
demonstration program
30.34B.010 18.50.010 Purpose and applicability
18.50.030
Deleted 18.50.020 Definitions
30.91E.060 18.50.020(1), EDDS
24.70.140,
17.05.310(13)
30.91E.070 18.50.020(2) Effective impervious surface
30.91F.450 18.50.020(3) Forested area
30.911.060 18.50.020(4) Innovative site design
Deleted 18.50.020(5) PDS
30.91D.340 18.50.020(6) DPW
30.91R.080 18.50.020(7) Reduced discharge
development
30.34B.020 18.50.040 Project sel. committee-
creation & membership
30.34B.030 18.50.050 Project sel. committee-duties
& authority
30.34B.040 18.50.060 Accepted projects-compl. with
appl. requirements
30.34B.050 18.50.070 Minimum performance
standards for participation
30.34B.060 18.50.080 Develpmnt revw process

28

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.34B.070 18.50.090 Deviations from SCC
30.34B.080 18.50.100 Deviation from EDDS
30.34B.090 18.50.110 Program evaluation
30.34B.100 18.50.120 Rulemaking authority
30.34B.110 18.50.130 Sunset
Deleted 18.50.140 Severability
30.42B.010 18.51.010 Purpose
30.42B.020 18.51.020 Applicability
30.42B.025 18.51.025 PRD not a rezone action
30.42B.030 18.51.030 Procedures
Deleted 18.51.047 Dwelling unit calcs.

Deleted 18.51.048 Min. density regs.

Deleted 18.51.057 Retire house/apt PRD stds

30.42B.040 18.51.060 Unit yield and bonus

30.42B.100 18.51.070 Design criteria: General

30.42B.210 18.51.070 Official site plan - effect &
recording procedure

30.42B.115 18.51.080 Design criteria: Open space

30.42B.125 18.51.090 Design criteria: Landscaping

30.91F.200 18.51.090(10)(b) |Fence

30.91S.070 18.51.090(10)(c) [Screen

30.42B.130 18.51.100 Design criteria: Tree
retention

30.91D.450 18.51.100(9)(a) [Drip line

30.91S.320 18.51.100(9)(b) |Significant tree

30.42B.135 18.51.110 Design criteria: Drainage
detention facilities

30.91H.210 18.51.120 Housing, low-income

(Temporary Housing
Demonstration Program)

29

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91H.180 18.51.120(2) Household

30.91H.200 18.51.120(2) Housing diversity

30.91H.220 18.51.120(2) Housing, low-income

30.91H.230 18.51.120(2) Housing, mixed-income

30.91H.240 18.51.120(2) Housing, moderate-income

30.911.050 18.51.120(2) Innovative neighborhood
design

30.42B.140 18.51.125 Design criteria: Roads,
access, circulation,
pedestrian facilities and
parking

30.42B.145 18.51.130 Design criteria: Bulk
requirements

30.42B.150 18.51.140 Design criteria: Specific
housing types

30.42B.200 18.51.150 Approval of PRD official site
plan - decision criteria

30.42B.220 18.51.170 Rev. of official site plan

30.42B.230 18.51.180 BSP

30.42B.240 18.51.190 Other uses permitted
Maintenance of site

30.42B.250 18.51.200 improvements

30.34C 18.51.210 Temporary housing
demonstration program

30.34C.005 18.51.210 Applicability

30.34C.010 18.51.210 Establishment

30.34C.020 18.51.210 Definitions

30.34C.030 18.51.210 Purpose

30.34C.040 18.51.210 Project selection committee

30.34C.050 18.51.210 Project selection

30

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.34C.060 18.51.210 The development review
process

30.34C.070 18.51.210 Deviation from sections of the
SCC

30.34C.080 18.51.210 Deviation from the EDDS

30.34C.090 18.51.210 Evaluation

30.34C.100 18.51.210 Sunset clause

30.31C.010 18.52.010 Purpose

30.31C.020 18.52.020 Definitions

Deleted 18.52.020 Definitions

30.91A.130 18.52.020(2) Airport hazard

30.91A.140 18.52.020(3) Airport hazard area

30.91S.680 18.52.020(4) Structure

30.91T.120 18.52.020(5) Tree

30.91A.240 18.52.020(6) Approach area

30.91T.080 18.52.020(7) Transitional area

30.91T.140 18.52.020(8) Turning area

30.31C.030 18.52.030 Landing field areas

30.31C.040 18.52.040 Airport zoning commission-
duties

30.31C.050 18.52.050 Height variances

30.31C.060 18.52.060 Acquisition of air rights

30.31E.020 18.53.010 Terms

30.31E.180 18.53.020 Permitted density

30.31E.010 18.53.030 Purpose & applicability

30.31E.200 18.53.030 Procedure: appl. for official
site plan

30.31E.210 18.53.035 BSP

1 30.31E.300 18.53.040 Revisions Determination of whether a revision is major or minor to be

made through code interpretation process.

31

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.31E.310 18.53.050 Approval expiration after 4
yIs.
30.31E.150 18.53.060(10) Sidewalks/walkways
30.31E.160 18.53.060(11) & |Utilities
(12)
30.31E.170 18.53.060(13) & |Landscaping and open space
(15)
30.31E.100 18.53.060(1-3), |Gen perf & design stds
(14) & (16)
30.31E.110 18.53.060(4) Setbacks
30.31E.120 18.53.060(5), (6) |Lot area - width & coverage
& (7)
30.31E.130 18.53.060(8) Bldg height
30.31E.140 18.53.060(9) Parking
30.31D.010 18.54.010 Purpose and Applicability MC Zoning & Min Excavation procedures & perf stds. Updated
1 to comply with state regulations (ch. 78.44 RCW) controlling
reclamation.
30.31D.020 18.54.010 Minimum zoning criteria
30.32C.100 18.54.010 Mineral excavation: regs &
stds
30.31D.200 18.54.020(1) Conditional use permit:
application and review for
excavation
30.31D.210 18.54.020(2)(3) |Decision criteria
30.31D.100 18.54.030(1)(e) |General performance stds
30.31D.110 18.54.030(1)(f)  |Landscaping: planting screen
30.31D.120 18.54.030(1)(g) |Setbacks
30.31D.130 18.54.030(1)(h) |Protection of water quality
30.31D.140 18.54.030(1)(i)  |Blasting
30.31D.150 18.54.030(1)()) Underground excavations

32

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.31D.160 18.54.030(1)(I)  [Topsoil
30.31D.220 18.54.030(2)(a)- |Additional conditions

(f)
30.31D.230 18.54.040 Inspections
Deleted 18.54.060 Proc f/revoke excav permit
30.31D.240 18.54.060 Revocation of approval
30.42E.010 18.55 Purpose and applicability
Deleted 18.55.010(2)(3)(5 |Mobile home parks -

)&(6) establishment
30.42E.030 18.55.010(3) Addtl. submittal requirements
30.42E.110 18.55.015 BSP
30.42E.100 18.55.020; MHP-design standards

18.55.010(1)
30.42E.040 18.55010(4) Official site plan
30.31B 18.56 Freeway Service zones
30.31B.020 18.56.010 Minimum zoning criteria
30.31B.100 18.56.020 Gen performance stds
30.31B.200 18.56.030; Official site plan

18.56.050
30.31B.210 18.56.035 BSP

1 30.31B.300 18.56.040 Revisions to approved site Determination of whether a revision is major or minor to be
plans made through code interpretation process.

30.31A 18.60 BP, PCB And IP Zones
30.31A.010 18.60.010 Purpose & applicability
30.31A.020 18.60.020 Minim zoning criteria
30.31A.200 18.60.030 Rezone procedures
30.31A.210 18.60.040 Preliminary site plan
30.31A.300 18.60.060 Reqs for final plan
30.31A.310 18.60.070 Approval of final plan
30.31A.400 18.60.080 Final plan disputes

33

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.31A.220 18.60.085 BSP
30.31A.600 18.60.090 Revocation of approval
1 30.31A.500 18.60.095 Revisions to final plans Determination of whether a revision is major or minor to be
made through code interpretation process.
30.31A.100 18.60.100; Gen performance
18.60.156 requirements

30.31A.110 18.60.120 PCB zone regs.

30.31A.120 18.60.130 BP zone performance
standards

30.91G.060 18.62.03(5) Governmental facilities

30.91A.080 18.62.030(1) Adequacy recommendation

30.91A.270 18.62.030(2) Arterial

30.91D.260 18.62.030(3) Development phasing overlay
or DPO

30.91S.360 18.62.030(8) Site-based public facilities

30.91U.030 18.62.030(9) UGA plan

30.31F.010 18.65.010 Purpose and Applicability

30.31F.020 18.65.020 Minimum zoning criteria

30.31F.200 18.65.030 Procedural reqts.

30.31F.100 18.65.040(1) Gen Perform standards

30.31F.110 18.65.040(2) RB zone perf stds

30.31F.120 18.65.040(3) RFS zone perf stds

30.31F.130 18.65.040(4) RI zone perf stds

30.31F.210 18.65.050 Binding site plan (BSP)

30.34A.010 18.68.010 Purpose

30.34A.020 18.68.020 Eligiblity for demonstration
program

30.91D.190 18.68.020(1)(d) |Developable area

30.91A.230 18.68.030 Applicant

30.91C.180 18.68.030 Committee

34

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91M.020 18.68.030(8) Major transit corridor
30.34A.030 18.68.040 Submittal requirements
30.34A.040 18.68.050 Centers review committee
1 30.34A.050 18.68.060 Public meeting and notice PDS responsible for publishing notice of public meetings for
demonstration projects.
1 |30.34A.060 18.68.070 Public open house and notice |EDC "invited" not "required" to co-sponsor open house
1 30.34A.070 18.68.080 Procedures - director's Clarifying that recording of new concomitant agreement
decision supersedes earlier official site plans
5 30.34A.080 18.68.090 Special development Mechanical screening required; no longer optional.
standards
5 30.34A.090 18.68.090(1)(e), |Decision criteria Clarifying decision criteria rather than merely citing to purpose of
(f). (9) chapter
30.34A.100 18.68.100 Permitted and prohibited uses
30.34A.110 18.68.110 Modifications to SCC and
standards
30.34A.120 18.68.120 Appeals
30.34A.130 18.68.130 Program evaluation
30.34A.140 18.68.140 Rulemaking authority
30.34A.150 18.68.150 Sunset
30.28.072 18.71.010(1); Nonconforming uses
.060; .070; & .040
30.28.075 18.71.020; .030 |Nonconforming uses -
structures
30.28.070 18.71.030 Nonconforming structures
30.28.072(4) 18.71.040 Nonconforming uses - Clarifies that nonconforming uses can only be expanded on

expansion

properties under ownership at time of nonconformance and
where use was permitted at time of nonconformance.

35

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 18.71.050 Reloc/noncon.-nec. by
condem
30.42C 18.72 Conditional use permits
30.42C.010 18.72 Purpose & applicability
30.43A 18.72 Administrative CU Permit New permit type; consolidates process for special and
2 temporary uses. PDS decision appealable to hearing examiner.
Regular notice required.
30.43A.010 18.72 Purpose & applicability See note for 30.43A.
30.43B 18.72 Variances
30.43B.010 18.72 Purpose and applicability
3 30.43B.020 18.72.010; Variance procedure All variances now Type 1 (dept. decision) with appeal to
18.72.075 examiner.
30.43B.100 18.72.020 Decision criteria-variances
Deleted 18.72.030(1) V (HE), CU (HE), ACU (HE)-
effect of decision
Deleted 18.72.030(2) V (PDS), ACU (PDS)
30.42C.020 18.72.040 Cond use permit procedure
2 [30.42C.100 18.72.060 Decision criteria Specific decision criteria added.
30.43A.100 18.72.060 Decision crit-Admin CU prmts | See note for 30.43A.
Deleted 18.72.060 CU and SU prmts-cond for
grant
30.42C.030 18.72.080 Previous use-occupancy
30.43A.020 18.72.090 Admin CU permit-procedure [See note for 30.43A.
Deleted 18.72.130 Application form.
30.70.030 18.72.130; Submittal requirements Department required to establish submittal requirement
5 32.50.050, others checklists and make available. Specific lists removed from
code. Dept. may waive reqt. in writing if item is clearly not
necessary.
Deleted 18.72.135 Submit/complete regs

36

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 18.72.135 Submittal/completeness reqs
30.86.210 18.72.140(3), (8) |Conditional use permit fees
& (9)
30.86.220 18.72.140(4), (2) |Administrative conditional use
& (6) permit fees
30.70.050 18.72.150; Notice of application - method | All notice requirements noted in one table. BLA and short plat
2 32.50.060 and timing requirements (timing of notice) made same as others. Notice
must be provided within 10 days, not 7.
Deleted 18.72.155 Permit procs/notice-attached
& detatched acc apts, MHPs,
B&B
Deleted 18.72.155 Permit procs/notice-attached
& detatched acc apts, MHPs,
B&B
Deleted 18.72.160 Notice of hearing-V (HE), CU
(HE)
Deleted 18.72.175(1) Notice of decis & appeal
process
Deleted 18.72.175(2) Notice of decis & appeal
process
Deleted 18.72.179 Expir of CU, TU, ACU, &V
applic
30.70.140 18.72.179 Expiration of application One year expiration of applications, but, expanded and clarified
5 18.73.105 authority to extend.
19.16.010
17.04.150(4)
30.70.150 18.72.180 Reapplication after denial of
project permit application.
Deleted 18.72.180 Reapplication

37 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.42C.210 18.72.190 Cont. jurisd. review or
revocation of permit

30.43A.110 18.72.190 Review or revocation of See note for 30.43A.
permit

30.43B.130 18.72.190 Variance review or revocation

Deleted 18.72.190 Continuous jurisdiction -
attached or detached
accessory apts., etc.

5 30.42C.110 18.72.192 Revision of CUPs Added detail; clarifying minor vs. major at generally 10%, except
traffic increases must be reviewed by Public Works.

30.43A.105 18.72.192 Revision of administrative See note for 30.43A.
CUP

30.42C.220 18.72.200 Transfer of ownership

30.43A.120 18.72.200 Transfer of ownership See note for 30.43A.

30.43B.110 18.72.200 Transfer of ownership

30.42C.200 18.72.210 Land use permit binder req.

30.43A.130 18.72.210 Land use permit binder reqt. |See note for 30.43A.
(ACU)

30.43B.120 18.72.210 Land use permit binder
required

Deleted 18.72.220 Vacation of permits/variances

Deleted 18.72.220 Vacation of permits/variances

Deleted 18.72.220 Vacation of permits/variances

30.42A.020 18.73 Rezone procedure

30.42A.010 18.73.010 Purpose and Applicability

Deleted 18.73.010 Authorization

38

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.42A.030 18.73.020 Initiating a rezone
30.73.030 18.73.020 Initiation of application
Deleted 18.73.025 Apps - filing
Deleted 18.73.027 Submit/complete regs
Deleted 18.73.030 Accept signa on apps
Deleted 18.73.040 Setting hearings
Deleted 18.73.040 Setting hearings
Deleted 18.73.050 Notice of hearing
Deleted 18.73.050(4) Notice of appl-timing &
content
Deleted 18.73.060(1) Public hearings-PC
Deleted 18.73.060(2) Public hearings
2 [30.42A.100 18.73.070 Rezone decision criteria Specific decision criteria added.
30.73.060 18.73.080 Planning commission action
30.42A.110 18.73.100 Withdrawal
Deleted 18.73.100 Abandoning land use
proposal
Deleted 18.73.105 Expir of rezone applicat
30.42A.120 18.73.110(12) Continuing classification and
enforcement
30.42A.130 18.73.110(2) Reapplication after denial w/o |Changed 6 months to 1 year before further action on same
2 prejudice property of a denied rezone can be heard; for consistency
throughout UDC.
30.86.200 18.73.120 Rezone fees
Deleted 18.80 Enforcement
Deleted 18.80.010 authority to enforce
Deleted 18.80.020 Title 28 SCC-applicable
Deleted 18.80.030 Order to stop work or cease
violation
Deleted 18.80.040 Notice and order

39

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 18.80.050 Declaration of Public
nuisance

Deleted 18.80.060 Misdemeanor

Deleted 18.80.070 Admin jurisdiction-
nonexclusive

30.91A.010 18.90.010 Abutting wall

30.91A.070 18.90.015 Access permit

30.91A.030 18.90.016 Accessible route of travel

30.91A.040 18.90.017 Accessory apt-attached

30.91A.050 18.90.018 Accessory apt-detached

30.91C.120 18.90.0195 Club

30.91A.110 18.90.020 Agriculture

30.91A.120 18.90.025 Airport

30.91A.150 18.90.030 Alley

30.91A.160 18.90.040 Amusement facility

30.91A.180 18.90.045 Animal run

30.91A.190 18.90.050 Antennae, commercial

30.91A.200 18.90.055 Antennae, private

30.91A.210 18.90.060 Antique

30.91A.310 18.90.070 Automobile repair, major

Deleted 18.90.070 Automobile repair, major

30.91A.320 18.90.075 Automobile repair, minor

30.91A.330 18.90.080 Automobile wrecking

30.91A.340 18.90.085 Automobile wrecking yard

30.91S.150 18.90.090 Service station

30.91B.030 18.90.095 Basement

30.91B.040 18.90.097 Bed/Bkfst guesthouse

30.91B.050 18.90.098 Bed/Bkfst inn

30.91B.110 18.90.100 Billboard

Deleted 18.90.105 Binding site plan

40

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91B.140 18.90.110 Boarding house
30.91B.150 18.90.115 Boat launch facility
30.91B.160 18.90.120 Boathouse
30.91B.200 18.90.125 Building
30.91B.210 18.90.135, Building area

29.40.025

30.91B.220 18.90.140 Building area, gross

30.91B.230 18.90.150 Building front

30.91B.240 18.90.155 Building height

30.91C.040 18.90.170 Caretaker's quarters

30.91C.050 18.90.175 Carport

30.91C.060 18.90.180 Cat, adult

30.91C.110 18.90.185 Cleaning establishment

30.91M.070 18.90.190 Medical Clinic

30.91C.130 18.90.200 Clubhouse

Deleted 18.90.200 Clubhouse

30.91C.170 18.90.205 Commercial use

Deleted 18.90.215 Commission

30.91C.200 18.90.220 Community Club

30.91C.220 18.90.225 Comprehensive park and
recreation plan

30.91C.230 18.90.225 Comprehensive plan

30.91C.240 18.90.230 Conditional Use

Deleted 18.90.235 Councill

30.91C.310 18.90.240 Country club

Deleted 18.90.245 Dangerous waste “Health district” will replace “district” in text

30.91D.030 18.90.250 Day

Deleted 18.90.250 Day

30.91D.040 18.90.255 Day care

30.91D.050 18.90.260 Day care center

41

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91D.090 18.90.263 Demolition or construction
debris

30.91D.150 18.90.264 Designated storage area

Deleted 18.90.264 Storage, Designated area See “Sludge, stabilized or digested”

30.91D.310 18.90.265 Dock

30.91D.320 18.90.270 Dog, adult

30.91D.480 18.90.280 Duplex

30.91D.490 18.90.285 Dwelling

30.91D.500 18.90.295 Dwelling, multiple family

30.91D.510 18.90.300 Dwelling, single family

30.91D.520 18.90.305 Dwelling, temporary

30.91D.530 18.90.311 Dwelling unit

30.91E.040 18.90.315 Easement, exclusive

30.91E.130 18.90.317 Equestrian center

30.91E.230 18.90.320 Excavations

30.91E.250 18.90.325 Explosives

Deleted 18.90.327 Extremely hazardous waste

30.91F.010 18.90.330 Fabrication shop

30.91F.070 18.90.335 Fallout shelter

30.91F.080 18.90.340 Family

30.91F.090 18.90.345 Family care home

30.91F.100 18.90.350 Family day care home

30.91F.110 18.90.355 Family rehabilitative home

30.91F.160 18.90.360 Farm product processing

30.91F.180 18.90.365 Farm worker dwelling

Deleted 18.90.370 Feasibility study

30.91F.230 18.90.375 Financial institutions

30.91F.330 18.90.380 Fish farm

Deleted 18.90.380 Fish farm

30.91F.350 18.90.385 Fix-it shop

42

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 18.90.385 Repair service/locksmith(Fix-it| See also SCC 30.66B.500(9).
shop)

30.91F.480 18.90.390 Forestry

30.91F.500 18.90.395 Foster home

30.91F.520 18.90.400 Fuel yard

30.91G.010 18.90.405 Garage, private

Deleted 18.90.410 Garage, public

30.91G.080 18.90.420 Greenhouse

30.91G.090 18.90.422 Grooming parlor

30.91G.120 18.90.430 Group care facility

30.91G.130 18.90.435 Guest house

30.91G.140 18.90.440 Gymnasium

30.91H.020 18.90.445 Hammerhead

30.91H.030 18.90.450 Hardware store

30.91H.050 18.90.451 Hazardous waste

30.91H.060 18.90.452 Hazardous waste storage

30.91H.070 18.90.453 Hazardous waste treatment

30.91H.080 18.90.454 Hazardous Waste
treatment/storage facility,
offsite

30.91H.090 18.90.455 Hazardous Waste
treatment/storage facility,
onsite

30.91H.100 18.90.458, Hearing Examiner

28.08.020(3)
1 |30.91H.140 18.90.460 Homeowner's association

Deleted 18.90.460 Homes assoc

30.91H.120 18.90.465 Home improvement center

30.91H.130 18.90.470 Home occupation

30.91H.150 18.90.471 Homestead parcel

43

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91H.160 18.90.475 Hospital
1 |30.91H.170 18.90.480 Hotel From Webster's

30.91S.440 18.90.485 Small animal husbandry
30.91J.010 18.90.494 Junk
30.91J.020 18.90.495 Junkyard
30.91K.010 18.90.500 Kennel, commercial
30.91K.020 18.90.505 Kennel, private breeding
30.91K.030 18.90.506 Kennel, private non-breeding
30.91K.050 18.90.507 Kitchen
30.91L.050 18.90.510 Lath house
30.91L.080 18.90.515 Licensed practitioners
30.91L.090 18.90.517 Livestock auction facility
30.91L.100 18.90.520 Loading space
Deleted 18.90.525 Lot
30.91L.130 18.90.530 Lot area
30.91L.140 18.90.535 Lot, corner
30.91L.150 18.90.540 Lot coverage, permitted
Deleted 18.90.545 Lot, depth See “Lot, existing legal”
30.91L.170 18.90.550 Lot line, front
30.91L.180 18.90.555 Lot line, rear
30.91L.190 18.90.560 Lot line, side
30.91L.200 18.90.565 Lot, through
30.91L.210 18.90.570 Lot, width
30.91L.230 18.90.575 Lumber yard
30.91M.080 18.90.577 Metal working shop
30.91E.140 18.90.580 Equestrian center, mini
30.91M.110 18.90.585 Mini self storage
30.91M.140 18.90.590 Mobile home
30.91M.160 18.90.595 Mobile home park
30.91M.170 18.90.597 Model hobby park

44

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91M.180 18.90.599 Model home
30.91M.190 18.90.600 Model house/sales office
Deleted 18.90.603 Moderate risk waste

1 |30.91M.200 18.90.605 Motel From Webster's
30.91N.050 18.90.615 Nonconforming structure
Deleted 18.90.615 Nonconforming structure
30.91N.070 18.90.620 Nonconforming use
Deleted 18.90.620 Nonconforming use
30.91N.120 18.90.625 Nursery
30.91N.130 18.90.630 Nursing home
Deleted 18.90.635 Ordinary high water mark
30.91P.090 18.90.645 Park, private
30.91P.100 18.90.650 Park, public
30.91P.050 18.90.651 Park-&-ride lot
30.91P.010 18.90.653 Park-&-pool lot, small
30.91P.060 18.90.655 Parking, off-street
30.91P.070 18.90.660 Parking space
30.91P.180 18.90.665 Personal service shops
30.91P.190 18.90.668 Pet shop
Deleted 18.90.670 Planning director
30.91P.250 18.90.675 Political sign
30.91P.260 18.90.680 Premises
30.91P.270 18.90.685 Preschool

1 |30.91P.300 18.90.690 Prime farmland Was "prime agricultural soil"
30.91P.310 18.90.695 Print shop
30.91P.320 18.90.700 Printing plant
30.91P.360 18.90.703 Public accommodation
30.910Q.010 18.90.704 Qualified landscape designer
30.91R.010 18.90.705 Racetrack
30.91R.140 18.90.709 Retall

45

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91R.150 18.90.709 Retall store
Deleted 18.90.710 Rest home
30.91R.180 18.90.711 Retirement apartments
30.91R.190 18.90.712 Retirement housing
Deleted 18.90.715 Road, private
Deleted 18.90.720 Rooming house
Deleted 18.90.725 Rural industry
30.91S.020 18.90.730 Sanitary landfill
30.91S.050 18.90.735 School, K-12, pub/priv/paroc
30.91S.060 18.90.740 School, other
Deleted 18.90.740 Educational facility, other
30.91S.080 18.90.745 Secondhand store
30.91S.160 18.90.750 Setback
30.91S.180 18.90.755 Shooting range
30.91S.310 18.90.760 Sign
30.91S.410 18.90.765 Sludge
30.91S.430 18.90.767 Sludge utilization
30.91S.450 18.90.770 Social service center
30.91S.500 18.90.775 Solid waste
Deleted 18.90.780 Spec use permit
30.91S.530 18.90.785 Store, specialty
30.91S.420 18.90.786 Sludge, Stabilized/digested
30.91S.550 18.90.787 Stable
Deleted 18.90.790 Stands fruit/veg
Deleted 18.90.795 Staple crops
30.91S.590 18.90.800 Storage structure
30.91S.650 18.90.810, Street

19.12.230
30.91S.660 18.90.815, Structure

32.10.110(40)

46 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91S.700 18.90.820 Studio

30.91T.010 18.90.825 Tavern

Deleted 18.90.830 Temporary See “Slope, toe of”".

30.91T.040 18.90.835 Temporary residential sales
coach

30.91T.060 18.90.840 Townhouse

30.91T.070 18.90.842 Transit center

1 |30.91R.050 18.90.845 Recreational vehicle Revised to match the WAC

30.91R.060 18.90.850 Recreational vehicle park

30.91U.040 18.90.855 Ultralight airpark

30.91U.050 18.90.860 Ultralight vehicle

30.91U.090 18.90.863 UGA's

30.91U.100 18.90.865 Use

30.911.030 18.90.866 Incidental use

Deleted 18.90.866 Use, incidental

30.91U.110 18.90.870, Utility

32.10.110(47)

30.91U.130 18.90.873 Utilization

30.91V.010 18.90.875 Variance

30.91V.020 18.90.880 Veterinary clinic

30.91W.080 18.90.885 Wholesale

30.91W.090 18.90.900 Woodwaste

30.91W.100 18.90.902 Woodwaste recycling

30.91W.110 18.90.904 Woodwaste storage

30.917.010 18.90.905 Zero lot line development

30.917.020 18.90.910 Zone

30.91Z7.040 18.90.915 Zone map

Deleted 19.04.010 Title

Deleted 19.04.020 Purpose

30.41A.080 19.08.016 Rural cluster subdivisions

47 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 19.08.016 Allow sbdv under RCS provis
30.41A.020 19.08.020(1)-(8) |Exemptions
30.41A.030 19.08.020(9)&(10 |Prior divisions of land
)

30.41B.025 19.08.020(9); Prior division of land
20.12.020(8)

Deleted 19.12.010 General

30.91A.060 19.12.030 Access panhandle

Deleted 19.12.050 Auditor

30.91B.180 19.12.080, Boundary line adjustment
29.04.020 (BLA)

Deleted 19.12.100 County

30.91C.380 19.12.110 Cul-de-sac

30.91D.070 19.12.120 Dedication

30.91D.110 19.12.125, Department
27.08.012

Deleted 19.12.130 Director

30.91E.030 19.12.140 Easement

Deleted 19.12.145 Executive

Deleted 19.12.150 Hearing Examiner

Deleted 19.12.160 Improvements See also SCC 30.62.500

30.91L.120 19.12.170, Lot Consolidating various definitions.
20.08.060,

1 29.04.060,

18.90.525,
19A.20.160,
32.10.110

Deleted 19.12.180 Modification

Deleted 19.12.185 Dept of Plan. & Dev Services

30.91P.220 19.12.190 Plat, final

48

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title
30.91S.720 19.12.190 Subdivision, final
30.91P.240 19.12.200 Plat, prelim
30.91S.730 19.12.200 Subdivision, preliminary
30.91R.200 19.12.210, Right-of-Way Clarifying that R/W means public ownership.
19A.20.230
30.91R.230 19.12.220, Road, private
20.08.080
30.91S.710 19.12.240, Subdivision
21.08.190,
26B.51.130
Deleted 19.12.250 Technical review See also SCC 30.53A. 700(13)
Deleted 19.12.260 Transportation plan
Deleted 19.12.270 Zoning resolution
1 30.70.020 19.16.010 Preapplication meeting Preapplication required for certain projects; not optional.
Applicant may request pre-application for any project.
Deleted 19.16.010 Application submittal
Deleted 19.16.010(1) Pre-app conference
Deleted 19.16.010(2) Submittal and fees
Deleted 19.16.010(3) Expiration of prelim plat apps
Deleted 19.16.010(5) Concurrent applications
Deleted 19.16.010(6) Environmental review
1 30.41A.060 19.16.010(7) Subdivision name reservation |Deleted 40 month time limit for reserving name.
Deleted 19.16.035 Notice of applic-subdivs
Deleted 19.16.040 Notice of hearing
30.41A.040 19.16.050 Procedure, special notice &
timing requirements
Deleted 19.16.050 Hearing and approval
procedure
Deleted 19.20

49

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41A.600 19.20.010 Final subdivision applicat -
approval timing.
30.41A.300 19.20.010, Prelim subdv approval-term
19.20.050
30.41A.330 19.20.020 Revisions after prelim
subdivision approval
Deleted 19.20.020 Changes after prelim
approval.
1 30.41A.800 19.20.020(2) Review and revocation of Providing consistent reference to review and revocation
approval procedure in chapter 30.71.
1 30.41B.800 19.20.020(2) Review and revocation of Providing consistent reference to review and revocation
approval procedure in chapter 30.71.
30.41B.310 19.20.020; 20.32 |Revs after prelim approv
30.41A.320 19.20.030 Prohib against other subdivs
30.41A.310 19.20.040 Prelim subdiv withdrawal
Deleted 19.20.050 Prelim plat lapse
1 30.41A.050 19.22.030(1), Submittal requirements Referencing 30.70.030 rather than listing submittal requirements
19.16.010(4) in every chapter.
30.41A.180 19.22.050 Decision crit-min net dens. in
UGAs
1 30.41A.100(1)- |(19.24.010(1)-(3) |Decision criteria-general Edits to be consistent with RCW 58.17.110 re: safe walking
(4) conditions for students.
30.41A.110 19.24.020 Decision criteria-flood haz
areas
30.41A.120 19.24.030 Decision crit-health dist
30.41A.130 19.24.040 Decision crit-school dist
30.41A.140 19.24.050 Decision crit-fire district
1 |30.41A.150 19.24.060 Decision criteria-parks Edited to make specific reference to park impact fee chapter.
30.41A.160 19.24.070 Fire Code
Deleted 19.24.070 Fire code

50

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41A.170 19.24.080 Shoreline management
Deleted 19.24.080 Shoreline management
1 30.41C.100 19.24; 20.20.080 |Decision criteria Reference to applicable criteria for subdivisions and short
subdivisions.
30.41A.200 19.28.010 Design standards-genl
Deleted 19.28.010 Standards - General
1 30.41A.210 19.28.020 Design standards - roads Clarifying current practice allowing private roads in PRDs and
rural cluster subdivisions when approved by county engineer.
1 [30.41A.220 19.28.030 Design stds - drainage Cross reference to drainage chapter for modifications.
30.41A.230 19.28.040 Design stds-Pub access-
publicly owned or controlled
witr bodies
30.41A.240 19.28.060 Design standards-Lot size
averaging
30.41A.410 19.32.010 Improvements-how pledged
30.84.050 19.32.010, Notice of non-compliance and
24.50.020, forfeiture of proceeds
24.50.035,
32.10.260
Deleted 19.32.020 Surety requirement
30.41A.430 19.32.030 Install of improvements-time
limits
30.41B.400 19.32.030; Install of improvements
20.26.050
30.41A.610 19.32.040 Monumentation
30.41A.400 19.32.050 Const drawings-Submittal &
review
30.41A.420 19.32.060 As built plans-submittal
Deleted 19.36.010 Purpose

51

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41A.215 19.36.010 - Design standards
19.36.050 modification-roads
Deleted 19.36.020 Applicability
Deleted 19.40 Final Plat
30.41A.640 19.40.010(2), (5) [Notice of app/PDS review for
& (4) final subdiv
30.41A.645 19.40.010(3), (7), |Council procedure and public
(6), (9), (10), notice
8)@)-(f)
30.41A.650 19.40.010(8) Council action
Deleted 19.40.020 Format
Deleted 19.40.030 Req'd info
Deleted 19.40.040 Supplem info
30.41A.660 19.40.050 Taxes
30.41A.620 19.40.060 Miscellaneous approvals
Deleted 19.40.060 Misc approvals
Deleted 19.40.070 Dedications
Deleted 19.40.080 Acknowledge/certificates
1 |[30.41A.665 19.40.090 File w/Auditor Final plat must be recorded within 30 days of council approval.
30.41A.670 19.40.100 Effect of filing a final Citing to RCW for vesting of recorded plats.
subdivision
Deleted 19.40.100 Effect of filing a formal plat
30.41A.500 19.42.005 Model homes (MH)
2 |[30.41A.520 19.42.010 Elig f/model home permit Added fire protection reqt. for model homes.
30.41A.530 19.42.020 MH Application regs
Deleted 19.42.030 Eligibility certification
30.41A.510 19.42.040 Number of MH permits
authorized
Deleted 19.42.050 Proced xlist authorized
30.41A.540 19.42.060 MH Occupancy

52

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41A.550 19.42.070 MH - As-built submittal
Deleted 19.44.010 General
Deleted 19.44.020 Multi ownership
Deleted 19.44.030 Alter of installed
improvements

Deleted 19.44.040 Recording

Deleted 19.44.050 Power of council not affected

Deleted 19.56.010 Court review

30.41A.810 19.56.020 Segregation notice

30.41B.820 19.56.020, Segregation notice

20.36.020

Deleted 19.56.025 Duplex deve sngl fam subdiv

Deleted 19.56.030 Permit prohibition

30.41A.820 19.56.040 Sale or transfer w/o subd

30.41B.810 19.56.040; Sale or transfer w/o shrt Language added for consistency w/ subdivisions.

1 .
20.36.030 subdivision approval

Deleted 19.56.060 Director's auth

Deleted 19.56.070 T28 SCC-Applic-

Deleted 19.56.080 Order to cease violation

Deleted 19.58.010 Severability

Deleted 19.58.020 Effective date

Deleted 19.58.030 Repeals

30.41A.190 19.58.040 Decision criteria-signage

Deleted 19.58.040 Plat sighage

Deleted 19.60 Conversion of Pending &
Approved Prel. Plats to Rural
Cluster Subd. Appl.

Deleted 19.60.010 Purpose

Deleted 19.60.020 Application criteria &
requirements

53

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 19.60.030 Proc for approv of conversion
Deleted 19.60.040 Application conversion &

completeness status
Deleted 19.60.050 Term of converted RCS
30.41D 19A Binding site plans
Deleted 19A.10 Gen Provisions
Deleted 19A.10.010 Title
30.41D.010 19A.10.020; Purpose and applicability
19A.10.030
Deleted 19A.10.040 BSP & record of survey
Deleted 19A.10.050 Violation & enforcement
30.41D.340 19A.10.060 Recording with auditor
Deleted 19A.10.060 Recording with auditor
Deleted 19A.10.070 Severability
Deleted 19A.20 Definitions - Binding Site
Plans
Deleted 19A.20.010 Definitions specific to BSPs
30.91B.120 19A.20.020 Binding site plan
Deleted 19A.20.030 Security, Bond/perform
30.91C.250 19A.20.040 Condominium
30.91D.060 19A.20.050 Declaration of condominium
30.91C.260 19A.20.060 Condominium survey
map/plans
Deleted 19A.20.080 Dedication
Deleted 19A.20.090 Department
Deleted 19A.20.100 Director
Deleted 19A.20.110 Division
30.91E.180 19A.20.120 Establishment
30.91H.190 19A.20.130 Housing cooperative

54

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 19A.20.140 Improvements See also SCC 30.66B.500(7); responsible department for policy
& procedure is public works.
Deleted 19A.20.150 Lease
Deleted 19A.20.160 Lot
30.91M.030 19A.20.170 Master development plan
30.91P.200 19A.20.180 Phasing plan
Deleted 19A.20.190 PRD
30.91P.280 19A.20.200 Previously approved site plan
30.91R.030 19A.20.210 Record of survey
Deleted 19A.20.220 Revision
Deleted 19A.20.250 Site
Deleted 19A.20.260 Zoning code
Deleted 19A.30 Revw stds & Proc
5 30.41D.020 19A.30.010 Procedure for binding site Notice requirements changed from posting only to post, publish
plan and mail.
30.41D.040 19A.30.010 Addn’l submittal regs.
Deleted 19A.30.010(2) Review & approval of BSP
30.41D.110 19A.30.010(3)-(9) | Decision criteria: conditions
of approval
30.41D.100 19A.30.020 Decision criteria
30.41D.105 19A.30.020(3) Subsequent development
permits
30.41D.120 19A.30.030 Conditions: prevs aprvd site
plan
30.41D.130 19A.30.040 Conditions when concurrently
reviewed
30.41D.200 19A.30.050 Dsgn stds: Access reqgs
30.41D.210 19A.30.060 Rd/row estab & row

dedication

55

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 19A.30.070 Appl concur w/other apps for
same site
30.41D.030 19A.30.080 App process/county-owned
property
Deleted 19A.30.080 App proc for county owned
prop
30.41D.220 19A.30.090 Phased develop
30.41D.300 19A.30.100 Accept of site improv
30.41D.310 19A.30.110(1) Bond/performance security
Deleted 19A.30.120 Conv of rental units to condos
30.41D.320 19A.30.130 Revisions Added detail clarifying “minor” and major” revisions from SCC
2 18.72.192 - 10% increase or less is generally minor, but any
traffic increase must be reviewed by Public Works.
Deleted 19A.30.130 Revisions
Deleted 19A.30.140 Appeals
30.41D.350 19A.30.150 Vacation
Deleted 19A.40 Fees
30.86.130 19A.40.010 Binding site plan fees
19A.40.020
19A.40.030
19A.40.040
Deleted 19A.50 Submittal regs
Deleted 19A.50.010 Pre-app conference
Deleted 19A.50.020 Dir auth f/policies & proced
Deleted 19A.50.030 submit reqs BSP
Deleted 19A.50.045 Notice of application
30.41D.330 19A.50.050 Taxes
Deleted 19A.50.050 Taxes

56 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.83.010 2.01,18.11, Code interpretations Code interpretation process may be used for all parts of UDC,
18.13, 18.72.090, with specific exceptions for building & fire code. Clarifying
3 2.02.150 current practice where code questions are raised as part of
permit review and during hearing or appeal. Defining Type 1
interpret
30.81.010 2.01.040, Administrative authority
2.68.030,
18.72.090
30.82.010 2.01.040, Rulemaking Requiring public notice & review of new policies and procedures
2.68.050, affecting development reviews. Defines process for existing
18.72.090, authority; also covers emergency rules and status of existing
3 18.50.120, rules and policies
24.10.035,
24.10.040,
26B.52.130,
32.10.270
30.85.210 2.02.125 Notice and order appeal
hearing procedure
3 30.85.215 2.02.125 Decision of hearing examiner |Provides for imposition of monetary penalties by hearing
examiner. Allows examiner to reduce monetary penalties.
30.71.050 2.02.125 Appeal of type 1 decision Appellant must be a party of record (same as for current Type 2)
2 18.72.100
19A.30.140
1 |30.71.080 2.02.125(10) Notice of hearing Notice at least 14 days prior to hearing; was 15 days.
30.71.055 2.02.125(3) Effect of appeal
30.71.070 2.02.125(5)-(7)  |Notice of filing of appeal
30.71.060 2.02.125(8) Dismissal of appeal
30.72.040 2.02.130 Report of department and

transfer of file

57

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.71.090 2.02.130 (1) & (3) |Report of Dept.
1 30.71.100 2.02.140 Appeal hearing procedure Appellant burden of proof added at para. 5; clarifies existing
practice.
30.72.050 2.02.140 Open record hearing
procedure
30.71.110 2.02.150 Examiner’s decision on
appeal
30.72.060 2.02.150 Examiner’s decision
1 30.71.115 2.02.160 Notice of the examiner's Deleted requirement to use certified mail for notice of
decision examiner's decision.
1 30.72.062 2.02.160 Notice of examiner’s decision |Deleted requirement to use certified mail for notice of
examiner's decision. Regular mail instead
30.91P.110 2.02.165(1) Party of record
5 30.71.120 2.02.167 Reconsideration by the Clarified grounds, timing
examiner
2 130.72.065 2.02.167 Reconsideration Clarified grounds, timing for reconsideration
5 30.72.070 2.02.175 Appeal of Type 2 decision Allowing any aggrieved person to appeal of denial of
reconsideration request.
30.72.120 2.02.175(11-12) |County council decision Includes specific authority to remand; council to specify what
1 issues are remanded. May give direction on whether to re-open
hearing.
30.72.080 2.02.175(3-4(e)) |Requirements for filing a Type
2 appeal
30.72.085 2.02.175(5) Effect of appeal
30.72.090 2.02.175(5) Consolidation of multiple
appeals
30.72.110 2.02.175(6)(10) |County council closed record

appeal hearing

58

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.72.075 2.02.175(7) Summary dismissal of Type 2
appeal
30.72.100 2.02.175(9)(8) Notice of Type 2 appeal to
council
30.72.130 2.02.190 Effect & appeal of final council
decision
30.71.130 2.02.195 Appeal of examiner's decision
on Type 1 appeal
Deleted 20.04.010 Title
Deleted 20.04.020 Purpose
1 30.41A.010 20.04.020, Purpose and applicability Matching statements from state law (chapter 58.17 RCW),
19.08.010 especially regarding safe walking conditions for students
Deleted 20.08.010 General
Deleted 20.08.020 Councill
Deleted 20.08.030 Comp plan
Deleted 20.08.040 Decl of short subdiv
Deleted 20.08.050 Dedication
Deleted 20.08.051 Department
30.91D.460 20.08.053 Driveway
Deleted 20.08.055 HE
Deleted 20.08.070 Access panhandle
30.91P.230 20.08.092 Plat, Final Short
30.91S.270 20.08.092 Short plat
30.91S.290 20.08.092 Short subdivision, final
30.91S.300 20.08.100 Short Subdivision, preliminary
Deleted 20.08.110 Subdivider
30.91E.050 20.08.120 Easement, utilities
Deleted 20.08.120 Utilities easements

59

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41B.010 20.12.010; Purpose and applicability Match 30.41A, RCW, and title 20.
1 20.04.020;
2012.050
30.41B.070 20.12.015 Resource lands
30.41B.075 20.12.016 Short subdiv under RCS prov
30.41B.020 20.12.020(1-4), |Exemptions
(1)
Deleted 20.12.040 Public dedications
30.41B.120 20.12.060 Dec. crit-Min net density
Deleted 20.20 Procedure
30.86.110 20.20.020 Short subdivision fees
30.41B.060 20.20.040; ID markers and other postings
20.20.050
30.41B.030 20.20.045; Procedure & special notice  |Referencing procedural chapter. Publishing and posting
2 : ) .
20.20.070 requirements deadlines made same as other permits.
30.41A.070 20.20.060 Consent to access
30.41B.050 20.20.060 Consent to access
Deleted 20.20.075 Expir of prelim SP apps
30.41B.100 20.20.080 Decision criteria
Deleted 20.20.080(3)(a)- |Decision criteria-general
(h)
Deleted 20.20.090(1) Appeal of dec. on short sub.
Deleted 20.20.090(2) Appeal of dec. on short sub.
30.41B.300 20.20.100 Prelim short subdiv approval-
term
Deleted 20.24.010 Application requirements
30.41B.040 20.24.010; Submittal requirements
19.22.040;
19.22.030
Deleted 20.24.030 App-add info

60

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41B.600 20.26 Final short subdiv applic.
approval - timing
30.41B.605 20.26 Final short sub. application
aproval - form
Deleted 20.26.010 Final short subdivision applic
Deleted 20.26.020 Required info
30.41B.630 20.26.030 Dedications
30.41A.630 20.26.030; Dedications
19.40.070
Deleted 20.26.040 Acknowledgements & certifs
30.41B.610 20.26.050 Approv proced for final short
subdiv
30.41B.640 20.26.060; File with auditor
19.40.090(2)
Deleted 20.26.070 Effect of filing
30.41B.200 20.28.010 Design standards-gen (1) Allowing road easement and access panhandle area to count
3 toward lot area, as for subdivisions; (2) requiring minimum 2,000
sq. ft. building area as for BLAs.
30.41B.620 20.28.020 Monumentation
30.41B.205 20.32 Design stds-modification
Deleted 20.32.020 Req for modif
Deleted 20.32.050 Limit on auth to modify
Deleted 20.36.020 Segregation notice
30.41B.835 20.36.025 Duplex dev in single family
subdiv
5 30.41A.840 20.36.030 Enforcement Additional enforcement authority in superior court as allowed for
short plats.
Deleted 20.36.030 Injunctive remedy
30.41B.840 20.36.030(2-3) Enforcement
30.41A.830 20.36.040 Permit prohibition

61

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.41B.830 20.36.040 Permit prohibition

Deleted 20.36.050 Revocation procedure

Deleted 20.40.010 Repealer

Deleted 20.40.020 Severability

Deleted 20.40.030 Effective date

Deleted 20.45.010 Purpose

Deleted 20.45.020 App criteria & reqs

Deleted 20.45.030 Proc for approv of conversion

Deleted 20.45.040 Status of applications when
converted

Deleted 20.45.050 Term of converted RC subdiv
or short subdiv

30.44.010 21.04.010 Title

30.44.020 21.04.020 Authority & purpose

30.44.030 21.04.030 Shoreline mgmt act
guidelines...

30.44.040 21.04.040 Compliance w/other laws

30.44.600 21.08.005 Definitions-Generally

30.44.605 21.08.007 Appurtenance

30.91A.250 21.08.007 Appurtenance

1 30.44.655 21.08.015 Shoreline conditional use The word “shoreline” is added to differentiate this activity from a
“zoning” CU permit.

30.91S.190 21.08.015 Shoreline conditional use

Deleted 21.08.020 Councill

Deleted 21.08.030 County

30.44.610 21.08.050 Development, shoreline

30.91D.230 21.08.050 Development, shoreline

Deleted 21.08.050 Development, shoreline

30.44.615 21.08.052 Emergency, shoreline

30.91E.100 21.08.052 Emergency, shoreline

62

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.44.620 21.08.060 Floodplain
30.44.625 21.08.070 Floodway
30.91F.430 21.08.070, Floodway
27.08.055
30.44.630 21.08.080 Floodway fringe
30.91F.440 21.08.080, Floodway fringe
27.08.060
Deleted 21.08.090 Hearing Examiner
30.44.635 21.08.100 Master Program
30.91M.040 21.08.100 Master Program
30.44.645 21.08.120 Permit, shoreline
30.91S.200 21.08.120 Permit, shoreline
30.44.640 21.08.130 Ordinary high-water mark,
shoreline
30.44.650 21.08.140 Person
30.91P.160 21.08.140, Person
28.08.020(8)
30.44.675 21.08.150 Shorelines
30.91S.240 21.08.150 Shorelines
30.44.680 21.08.160 Shorelines of state
30.91S.250 21.08.160 Shorelines of state
30.44.685 21.08.170 Shorelines of statewide signif
30.91S.260 21.08.170 Shoreline of statewide
significance
30.44.690 21.08.175 Single fam residence
30.91S.330 21.08.175 Single-family residence
30.44.660 21.08.180 Shoreline substantial dev
30.91S.210 21.08.180 Shoreline substantial
development
Deleted 21.08.180 Substantial dev

63

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.44.665 21.08.190 Sub. Dev prior to 90.58 RCW
30.91S.220 21.08.190 Shoreline dev prior to Ch
90.58 RCW

30.44.670 21.08.200 Shoreline variance permit

30.91S.230 21.08.200 Shoreline variance

Deleted 21.08.200 Variance permit

30.44.695 21.08.210 Wetlands, shoreline or assoc
wetlands

30.91W.070 21.08.210 Wetlands, shoreline or assoc
wetlands, shoreln

30.44.100 21.12.010 Applicability

30.44.110 21.12.020 Dev exempted from
shoreline...

30.44.120 21.12.030 Reqs for exempted
developments

30.44.130 21.12.040 App of prmt system to
substan...

30.44.140 21.12.050 Letter of exempt for USCE
permit

30.44.150 21.12.060 Applic of permit sys to fed
agen

30.44.200 21.16.010 Administration

30.44.205 21.16.015 Permits reqd

30.44.210 21.16.020 App for s dev; cu; or var
permit

30.44.220 21.16.030 Fees

30.86.310 21.16.030 Shoreline Management
Permits-Fees

30.44.230 21.16.040 Permit processing

30.44.240 21.16.050 Department action

64

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.44.250 21.16.060 County action/apps w/o pub
hearing

30.44.260 21.16.070 County action/apps w/ pub
hearing

30.44.270 21.16.080 Permit, filing and form

30.44.280 21.16.090 Appeals to shorelines
hearings board

30.44.300 21.16.100 Effective date of permit

30.44.310 21.16.110 Limitations of permit

30.44.320 21.16.120 Time regs of permit

30.44.330 21.16.130 Revisions to s dev; cu;/v
prmts

30.44.340 21.16.140 Reapplication

Deleted 21.20 Part 3-Rev Crit for SD,
CU,V,NCD stds

30.44.400 21.20.010 Substantial development
permits

30.44.410 21.20.020 CU permits

30.44.420 21.20.030 Variance permits

30.44.430 21.20.040 Nonconforming dev stds

30.44.500 21.24.010 Enforcement-director's
authority

30.44.505 21.24.020 Chapter 30.85 SCC-
applicable

30.44.510 21.24.030 Order to cease violation

30.44.520 21.24.040 Notice of
violation/penalty/abate

30.44.530 21.24.050 Public nuisance

30.44.540 21.24.060 Alternative remedies

30.44.550 21.24.070 Admin jurisdiction- nonexclus

65

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
2 130.44.560 21.24.080 Permit recision Mailing "and" posting required; not mailing "or" posting.
30.44.700 21.30.010 River improvement program
established
30.44.710 21.30.020 River improvement program
fund established
30.44.720 21.30.030 Cooperative bank
stabilization projects -
authorization
30.44.730 21.30.040 Cooperative bank
stabilization projects -
requirements
30.44.740 21.30.050 Cooperative bank
stabilization projects - county
participation
30.44.750 21.30.060 Use of fund by department of
public works
30.44.760 21.30.070 Compliance with legal
requirements
Deleted 23.04.040 Title
30.61.010 23.04.080, 120 |Purpose and Applicability
Deleted 23.04.160 Severability
1 30.61.020 23.04.200 SEPA rules-adopt by ref Adopting all SEPA rules and future updates by reference rather
than with individual citations.
Deleted 23.08.010 General
Deleted 23.08.020 Council
Deleted 23.08.030 Department
30.91D.120 23.08.040 Department, acting
30.91D.130 23.08.050 Department, lead
30.91D.140 23.08.060 Department w/jurisdiction
30.91E.010 23.08.070 Early notice

66

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.910.020 23.08.080 Ordinance

30.91S.140 23.08.090 SEPA rules

30.91M.060 23.08.100 MDNS

30.91S.130 23.08.100 SEPA

Deleted 23.08.100 SEPA rules-adopt by ref

30.61.030 23.12.040 Use of exemptions

30.61.035 23.12.080 Exemption thresholds for

minor new construction

Deleted 23.12.120 Environ sensitive areas

30.61.100 23.12.160 Environ checkilist

30.61.120 23.12.200 Mitigated determination of

nonsignificance

30.61.115 23.12.200(2) & |Early notice of whether DS is
(3) likely

Deleted 23.12.240 SEPA rules-adopt by ref

30.61.055 23.16.040; Designat. of responsibil.
23.16.080; Officials & consultation
23.16.120

Deleted 23.16.160 Time Imts appl to SEPA

30.61.070 23.16.164 Exp o/all apps subj to SEPA

30.61.060 23.16.170; Time limits
32.50.070(2)

30.61.057 23.16.180 Completeness determination

30.61.065 23.16.200 Add'l timing considerations

30.86.500 23.16.240 SEPA Fees

30.61.220 23.16.280 Denial w/o EIS

Deleted 23.16.320 SEPA public info

Deleted 23.16.360 SEPA rules-adopt by ref

Deleted 23.20 Lead agency status...

67

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.61.040(1) & |23.20.040 Lead agency
2)
Deleted 23.20.120 SEPA rules-adopt by ref
30.61.045 23.24.040 Lead dept
Deleted 23.24.240 Specific proposals
30.61.110 23.28.080; Public notice
23.28.120;
23.28.040;
23.28.160
Deleted 23.28.200 Cost of notice
Deleted 23.28.240 SEPA rules-adopt by ref
30.61.130 23.32.040 EIS Preparation
30.61.140 23.32.080 EIS public hearing
30.61.150 23.32.120 No action-7 days aftr
publication
Deleted 23.32.160 SEPA rules-adopt by ref
30.61.200 23.36.010 Authority to condition
30.61.210 23.36.020 Authority to deny
30.61.230 23.36.030 SEPA policies Deleted school impact language; superseded by new school
1 impact ord. Condensed list by single reference to
comprehensive plan and UCD.
30.61.005 23.36.030(1) & |Legislative objectives
(2)
Deleted 23.36.040 SEPA rules-adopt by ref
Deleted 23.40 Appeals
3 30.61.300 23.40.010 SEPA appeals-general Appeal of TD for building and grading permits allowed. Type 1
to hearing examiner only.
1 30.61.310 23.40.022 Standard of rvw and hearing |Clarifying standard of review now in use but not codified.
procedure for SEPA appeals
30.61.330 23.40.040 Judicial review

68

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 23.44.040 SEPA rules-forms-adopt by
ref
Deleted 24.10 General Provisions
Deleted 24.10.010 Title
30.63A.010 24.10.020 Purpose & applicability
Deleted 24.10.025 Applicability
30.63A.020 24.10.030 Exemptions
30.63A.040 24.10.040 Dept. of PW authority
30.63A.050 24.10.045 Compliance w/ other law
30.63A.060 24.10.050 Relationship to ch 30.61 SCC
Deleted 24.10.055 Liability
Deleted 24.20 Drain Revw Proc & Drainage
Plans
Deleted 24.20.010 Develop. activity requir.
review
30.63A.100 24.20.015, Drain. rev. for resid. small
24.70.085 parcel dev. activ.
30.63A.110 24.20.020, Drain. review for other small
24.70.080 parcel develop act.
30.63A.120 24.20.025, Drain. review for major
24.70.075 develop activi.
30.63A.130 24.20.030 Owner & appl. to comply
30.63A.140 24.20.035 Drainage review process
30.63A.150 24.20.040 Targeted DP submit reqgs
30.63A.155 24.20.045 Full DP submit regs
30.63A.160 24.20.050 Revisions to DPs
30.63A.170 24.20.055 Drainage inspect proces
30.63A.180 24.20.060 Submittal of recd drwngs
30.63A.185 24.20.065 Process for const accept

69

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.86.510 24.20.075 Drainage fees
Deleted 24.30 Drainage req./rev. stds
30.63A.200 24.30.010 D system req. for all
development act. w/ DPs
30.63A.210 24.30.015 D system req. for major devel.
5 30.63A.220 24.30.020 Erosion and sedimentation Added authority for department to require mud in roads to be
control requirements cleaned up immediately, not just at end of day.
30.63A.230 24.30.025 Redevelopment
30.63A.240 24.30.030 Deten in Wetinds & Buffr
30.63A.250 24.30.035 Modifications or waivers of
regs.
30.63A.300 24.40.010 Maint. resp. for D facilit..
30.63A.310 24.40.015 Interim maint respons after
const
30.63A.320 24.40.020 Release of appl from maint
respons-crtn D fac
30.63A.330 24.40.025 Esmnts granted to cnty
30.63A.340 24.40.030 Drainage easements
30.63A.350 24.40.035 Maintenance covenant
30.63A.360 24.40.040 Sep. tracts for deten fac
30.84.070 24.50, 32.10.260, |Release of bond or other
19.32.010 security
30.63A.400 24.50.010 Security & insurance
30.63A.410 24.50.015 Performance sec--reqs
1 30.84.020 24.50.015, 19.32, |Bonds - form and amount Clarifying amount of performance security. See also
32.10.260 30.63A.410, 420, 430; 30.25.045
30.63A.420 24.50.020 Warranty sec--regs
30.63A.430 24.50.025 Maintenance sec--reqs

70

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.84.030 24.50.030, Duration and extension of
18.43.043 bond or other security device
period
30.84.010 24.50.040, Purpose and applicability Bonds and security devices
1 32.10.260,
18.43.043,
19.32.010
30.63A.440 24.50.045 Insurance reqgs
Deleted 24.60.010 Title 28 SCC
30.85.110 24.60.020, Stop work Clarifying authority currently used. General authority also resides
32.10.290 in UBC.
Deleted 24.70 Definitions
Deleted 24.70.010 Application of definitions
30.91A.220 24.70.015, Applicant
32.10.110(2),
17.05.310(1),
19.12.040
30.91B.080 24.70.020 Best management practices,
drainage
30.91B.130 24.70.025 Biofiltration
30.91C.280 24.70.035 Construction plans
30.91C.300 24.70.040 Conveyance systems
Deleted 24.70.045 Critical areas
Deleted 24.70.050 Department
30.91D.160 24.70.055 Design storm
30.91D.170 24.70.060 Detention
30.91D.180 24.70.065 Detention facility
Deleted 24.70.070 Development activity
Deleted 24.70.075 Development activity, major

71

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 24.70.080 Development activity, other
S.p.

Deleted 24.70.085 Development activity,
residential s. p.

Deleted 24.70.090 Director

30.91D.330 24.70.095 Downstream analysis

30.91D.350 24.70.100 Drainage

30.91D.360 24.70.105 Drainage basin

30.91D.370 24.70.110 Drainage facility

30.91D.380 24.70.115 Drainage impacts

30.91D.410 24.70.120 Drainage plan

30.91D.420 24.70.125 Drainage plan, full

30.91D.430 24.70.130 Drainage plan, targeted

30.91D.440 24.70.135 Drainage study

30.91E.150 24.70.145, Erosion

17.05.310(16)

30.91E.240 24.70.150 Existing site conditions

30.91G.050 24.70.160 Geotechnical engineering

30.91H.260 24.70.170 Hydrograph

30.911.010 24.70.175 Impervious surface

30.911.040 24.70.180 Infiltration

30.91L.010 24.70.185 Lake

Deleted 24.70.195 Mitigation

1 [30.910.030 24.70.200 Ordinary high water mark Revised to match the WAC

Deleted 24.70.205 Owner

30.91P.120 24.70.210 Peak discharge

30.91P.400 24.70.215 Public regional storm water
management facility

30.91R.020 24.70.220 Rational method

30.91R.070 24.70.225 Redevelopment

72

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91R.160 24.70.230 Retention
Deleted 24.70.230 Retention, drainage See also SCC 30.63.500(9)
30.91R.170 24.70.235 Retention facility
30.91S.090 24.70.240 Security, maintenance
30.91S.100 24.70.245 Security, performance
30.91S.110 24.70.250 Security, warranty
Deleted 24.70.255 Shorelines
30.91S.340 24.70.260, Site
29.04.080
30.91D.400 24.70.270 Drainage manual
Deleted 24.70.270 S C Drainage manual
Deleted 24.70.275 Soil
30.91S.520 24.70.280 Source control
30.91S.600 24.70.290 Storm water runoff
30.91S.610 24.70.295 Storm water treatment
30.91S.620 24.70.300 Storm water treatment facility
30.91S.640 24.70.305, Stream
32.10.110(39)
30.91U.080 24.70.310 Upstream analysis
30.91W.030 24.70.315 Watershed
30.91W.040 24.70.320 Watershed management plan
Deleted 24.70.325 Wetlands See30.91W.060
30.66A. 26A Park & Rec Facility Impact
Mitigation
30.66A.010 26A.01.010, Purpose & applicability
26A.01.200
30.66A.020 26A.01.010, Relationship to environmental
paragraph 3 impacts
30.91A.360 26A.02.080 Average household size
30.91C.190 26A.02.090 Community

73

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 26A.02.100 Developer

30.91D.200 26A.02.110 Development, park &
recreation

Deleted 26A.02.110 Development, park and See also SCC 30.63.500(10)
recreation

Deleted 26A.02.120 Director See30.91D.280

Deleted 26A.02.130 Dwelling unit

Deleted 26A.02.132 Fair market value In chapter 30.835, “fill” will be replaced by “flood plain fill”

30.91F.030 26A.02.140 Facility improvement

Deleted 26A.02.140 Park & rec facility See “Permit, special use”.
improvement

30.91F.040 26A.02.142 Facility requirement

Deleted 26A.02.142 Park & rec facility req

30.91F.050 26A.02.144 Facility requirement cost

Deleted 26A.02.144 Park & red facility req cost

Deleted 26A.02.150 Land dedication

30.91M.130 26A.02.160 Mitigation requirement, park &
recreation

Deleted 26A.02.170 Multi residential structure

30.91P.020 26A.02.180 Park & Recreation demand

30.91P.030 26A.02.190 Park & Recreation facility

Deleted 26A.02.200 Park & Rec level o/service See also SCC 30.44.650

30.91P.040 26A.02.210 Park & recreation ratio

30.91P.080 26A.02.220 Park land

Deleted 26A.02.230 Permitting agency

30.91R.090 26A.02.240 Region

Deleted 26A.02.260 Subdivision

30.66A.030 26A.03.010, Mitig of park & rec impacts

26A.03.020 required
30.66A.040 26A.03.030 Mitigation fee schedule

74

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66A.060 26A.03.030 Calculation of impact and mit.
requirement.
30.66A.070 26A.03.040 Variation from impact mitig
sched
30.66A.120 26A.03.060 Use of impact mitigation funds
30.66A.140 26A.03.070 Project across community
boundaries
30.66A.050 26A.03.080 Optional facility improvement
30.66A.052 26A.03.090 Optional land dedication or
conveyance
30.66A.055 26A.03.100 Credit to developer for land
dedication or conveyance in
excess of required mitigation
30.66A.090 26A.04.010 Timing of impact mitigat
determination
30.66A.100 26A.04.020 Time of performance
30.66A.110 26A.04.030 Trust accounts
30.66A.150 26A.04.040 Valid of preexisting
agreements
30.66A.130 26A.04.050 Use & disposition of
dedicated land
30.66A.160 26A.05.010 Appeals
Deleted 26A.06.010 Severability
30.66B 26B Concurrency and road impact
mitigation
Deleted 26B.11.080 Fees-how used Covered by new 30.66B.
Deleted 26B.11.100 RID participation See 30.66B.170, 30.66B.360
Deleted 26B.11.110 Effective dates Not necessary, covered by 30.66B.
Deleted 26B.50.010 Findings

75

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66B.005 26B.50.020 Purpose and applicability
30.66B.085 26B.50.020 Transportation needs report
30.66B.010 26B.50.030 Relationship to Ch 30.61
SCC
Deleted 26B.51.003 Approving authority
30.91A.280 26B.51.004 Arterial unit
30.91A.290 26B.51.005 Arterial unit in arrears
30.91C.010 26B.51.006 Capacity improvements
Deleted 26B.51.007 Capital facilities plan, school |This definition will be deleted and replaced with a revised
district definition proposed by DPW.
Deleted 26B.51.008 Comp plan
30.91C.330 26B.51.009 County road engineer
Deleted 26B.51.009 County road eng See "county engineer" 30.91C
Deleted 26B.51.010 Dedication
Deleted 26B.51.020 Department See 30.91D.110
Deleted 26B.51.030 Developer
30.91D.210 26B.51.040 Development, roads
30.91D.270 26B.51.050 Direct traffic impact
Deleted 26B.51.060 Director See 30.91D.280
30.91F.510 26B.51.070 Frontage improvements
30.91H.110 26B.51.075 Highway capacity manual
30.911.020 26B.51.080 Inadequate road condition
30.91L.060 26B.51.085 Level of service
30.91L.070 26B.51.085 Level of service, park and
recreation
30.910.010 26B.51.090 Offsite road improv
Deleted 26B.51.095 Public agency
30.91R.240 26B.51.100 Road system
30.91R.250 26B.51.105 Road system impact fee
30.91S.280 26B.51.120 Short subdivision

76

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91T.090 26B.51.132 Transportation element
30.91T.100 26B.51.133 Transportation needs report
30.91T.110 26B.51.135 Transportation service area
Deleted 26B.51.140 Unit
Deleted 26B.51.150 Urban area
Deleted 26B.51.160 WSDOT
30.66B.050 26B.52.020 Director of Public Works

recommendation
30.66B.060 26B.52.030 Authority to deny excessive
expenditure
30.66B.015 26B.52.040 Development mitigation
requirements
30.66B.320 26B.52.050(3) Impact fee - cost basis
30.66B.315 26B.52.050(5) Comprehensive Plan
amendment - analysis
30.66B.100 26B.52.060 Level of service standards
30.66B.110 26B.52.060(3) Ultimate capacity
30.66B.620 26B.52.060(5), |TDM - required
26B.55.130
30.66B.410 26B.52.080, Frontage improvement
26B.55.050 requirements
30.66B.420 26B.52.085, Access and transportation
26B.55.055 circulation requirements
30.66B.510 26B.52.090, Right-of-Way requirements
26B.55.060
30.66B.177 26B.52.100 Interlocals with state and cities
30.66B.720 26B.52.100 Mitigatin - city streets and

roads in other counties

77

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66B.710 26B.52.100, Mitigation - state highways
26B.55.070
30.66B.750 26B.52.110 Master road improvement
program
30.66B.820 26B.52.120 Variations - public agencies
30.66B.080 26B.52.130 Authorization for rules
30.66B.740 26B.52.140 Transportation benefit districts
30.66B.020 26B.52.150 Pre-submittal conference
30.66B.025 26B.52.160 Completeness determination
30.66B.030 26B.52.170 Other agencies with
jurisdiction
30.66B.035 26B.53.010 Traffic Study - when required
30.66B.040 26B.53.020 Traffic Study - author's
qualifications
30.66B.045 26B.53.040 Review of traffic study
30.66B.055 26B.55.010 Imposition of mitigation
requirements
30.66B.057 26B.55.010(5) Duplex residential building
permits
30.66B.075 26B.55.010)7) Revision after approval
30.66B.340 26B.55.020(2) Timing of payment
30.66B.310 26B.55.020, Impact fees
26B.52.050
1 30.66B.370 26B.55.022 Review of impact fees Clarifying that notice of impact fee only required for Type 1 and
Type 2 decisions.
30.66B.330 26B.55.025 Fee schedule
30.66B.120 26B.55.030 Concurrency determination

required

78

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66B.125 26B.55.030 Concurrency determination
process
30.66B.155 26B.55.030 (1) |Concurrency determination -
(d), (e), (D expiration
30.66B.150 26B.55.030(1)(b) |Changes to concurrency
& (c) determination
30.66B.130 26B.55.030(2) Concurrency determination
methodology
30.66B.160 26B.55.030(3)(b) |Aterial unitin arrears or at
ultimate capacity
30.66B.135 26B.55.030(4) Development deemed
concurrent
30.66B.167 26B.55.030(6) Options when a development
IS not concurrent
30.66B.170 26B.55.030(6)(c) |Arterial unitin arrears or IRC -
(i) (A-E) developer improvements
30.66B.145 26B.55.032 Concurrency determination -
forecasting LOS
1 30.66B.175 26B.55.034 Concurrency determination Changed 180 day limit to 6 months. (Subsection 11)
review or appeal
30.66B.180 26B.55.034 Concurrency determination Changed standing requirement for concurrency appeals
2 review or appeal associated with Type 1 projects to "party of record” from "any
person”. Matches other Type 1 appeals. (Subsection 3)
30.66B.185 26B.55.039 Concurrency determination -
standard of review
30.66B.210 26B.55.040 Inadequate road conditions
30.66B.220 26B.55.040 Improvements to remove IRCs
30.66B.440 26B.55.050(3), |Timing of improvments

26B.55.055(3)

79

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66B.520 26B.55.060(3) Right-of-Way width
30.66B.530 26B.55.060(6), |Compensation for right-of-way
)
30.66B.540 26B.55.060(8) Timing
30.66B.165 26B.55.090 Arterial unit in arrears -
special circumstances
30.66B.430 26B.55.095 Extent of improvements
30.66B.065 26B.55.100 Authority to withhold or
condition
30.66B.350 26B.55.110 Administration and impact fee | Referencing RCW 82.20 for refunds and deleting duplicative
2 payments provisions. Payment of fees under protest required if applicant
wishes to reserve the right to challenge the fee later
30.66B.360 26B.55.120 Relationship between impact
fees and special district fees
30.66B.070 26B.55.125 Record of development
obligation
30.66B.610 26B.55.130(1) & |TDM - general
(2)
30.66B.660 26B.55.130(3)(b) | TDM - procedures, submitting
proposals
30.66B.670 26B.55.130(4) Trip reduction credits - how
used
30.66B.680 26B.55.130(5) Trip reduction program -
discontinuance
30.66B.630 26B.55.130(6) & |TDM - trip reduction credits,
(8) onsite features
30.66B.650 26B.55.130(7), |TDM - additional trip reduction
(9), (10) credits
30.66B.645 26B.55.140 TDM - voluntary payment
30.66B.640 26B.55.140(2) TDM - offsite measures

80

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66B.810 26B.57.005 Deviations
Deleted 26B.58.020 Severability
30.66C 26C.20 School impact mitigation
30.66C.010 26C.20.010, Purpose and applicability
26C.20.020
Deleted 26C.22.020(1) Appendix F
Deleted 26C.22.020(10) |Development activity sch See also SCC 30.63.500(12)
impact
Deleted 26C.22.020(11) |Development approval New definition. This is a new definition which combines the
essence of previous definitions contained in several chapters of
relevant state and county statutes.
Deleted 26C.22.020(12) |Director
Deleted 26C.22.020(13) |District, school This definition is replaced with revised language proposed and
approved by DPW staff.
Deleted 26C.22.020(14) |District property tax levy rate
Deleted 26C.22.020(15) |Dwelling unit type
Deleted 26C.22.020(16) |Encumbered Definition revised to note that “subdivision” is “development” and
moved to Ch. 30.91D.
30.91E.190 26C.22.020(17) |Estimated school facility
construction cost
30.91F.020 26C.22.020(18) |Facility design capacity,
school
Deleted 26C.22.020(19) |Grade span
30.91A.350 26C.22.020(2) Average assessed value
Deleted 26C.22.020(20) |Growth Management
Act/GMA
Deleted 26C.22.020(20) |Growth management act
30.911.070 26C.22.020(21) |Interest rate
30.91L.020 26C.22.020(22) |Land cost per acre
Deleted 26C.22.020(23) |Multi-family unit

81

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91P.130 26C.22.020(24) |Permanent facilities
30.91R.100 26C.22.020(25) |Relocatable school facilities
30.91R.110 26C.22.020(26) |Relocatable school facilities

cost
30.91R.120 26C.22.020(27) |Relocatable school facilities
student capacity
30.91S.040 26C.22.020(28) |[School impact fee
Deleted 26C.22.020(29) |Single-family unit
30.91S.560 26C.22.020(30) [Standard of service
30.91S.580 26C.22.020(31) |State match percentage
30.91S.690 26C.22.020(32) |Student factor (Student
generation rate)
30.91C.020 26C.22.020(4) Capital facilities
30.91C.030 26C.22.020(5) Capital facilities plan
Deleted 26C.22.020(6) Council
Deleted 26C.22.020(7) County
Deleted 26C.22.020(8) Developer, school See also SCC 30.63.500(11)
30.91D.220 26C.22.020(9) Development, school
Deleted 26C.22.020(9) Development, school See also SCC 30.63.500(13)
30.66C.020 26C.24.010 School impact fee eligibility
30.66C.030 26C.24.020 Expiration of dist plans
30.66C.035 26C.24.030 Update of district plans
30.66C.040 26C.26.010 Min regs for sch dist cap fac
plans
30.66C.050 26C.26.020 Dept review & accept:
technical review comm
30.66C.055 26C.26.030 Council adoption
30.66C.060 26C.26.040 Correction of deficiencies
30.66C.065 26C.26.050 Delays
30.66C.045 26C.28 Impact fee calc formula

82

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.66C.100 26C.28.010, Fee required
26C.28.050

30.66C.110 26C.28.020 Impact fee schedule;
exemptions

30.66C.120 26C.28.030 Service areas establish..

30.66C.130 26C.28.040 Impact fee limitations

30.66C.150 26C.28.070 Credit for in-kind contrib

30.66C.160 26C.28.080 SEPA mitigation & other
review

30.66C.200 26C.30.010 Collection & transfer of fees

30.66C.210 26C.30.020 Use of funds

30.66C.220 26C.30.030 Refunds

30.66C.230 26C.30.040 Reimbursement for Co.
Admin. Costs...

30.66C.300 26C.32.010 Admin adjustment of fee
amount

30.66C.310 26C.32.020 Appeals of decisions-pro

30.66C.320 26C.32.030 Arbitration of disputes

Deleted 26C.34.020 Savings clause

Deleted 27.04.010 Title

30.65.010 27.04.020, Purpose and applicability

27.12.010

30.65.020 27.04.030 Intent

30.65.030 27.04.040 Nat'| FI00d Ins Program

30.91B.020 27.08.005 Base flood

30.91C.360 27.08.007 Critical facility

30.91D.100 27.08.010 Density fringe area

30.91D.250 27.08.015 Development, flood area

83

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.91D.280 27.08.018, Director

32.10.110(12),

28.08.020(2)
30.91F.130 27.08.019 Farmhouse
30.91F.220 27.08.020 Fill, flood plain
30.91F.360 27.08.025 Flood or flooding
30.91F.380 27.08.030 Flood hazard permit
30.91F.390 27.08.035 Flood insurance rate map
30.91F.400 27.08.040 Flood insurance study
30.91F.410 27.08.045, Floodplain

21.08.060
30.91F.420 27.08.050 Floodproofing
30.91L.220 27.08.065 Lowest floor
30.91N.040 27.08.070 New construction
30.91N.060 27.08.075 Nonconforming structure,

flood hazard
30.91N.080 27.08.080 Nonconforming use, flood
hazard

30.91R.040 27.08.081 Recreational vehicle
30.91S.510 27.08.082 Solid waste, flood hazard
30.91F.370 27.08.085 Flood hazard area, special
30.91S.670 27.08.090 Structure
30.91S.750 27.08.095 Substantial improvement
30.91S.570 27.08.097 Start of construction
30.91W.120 27.08.100 Works
30.65.040 27.12.020 Special FH areas established
30.65.050 27.12.030 ID on official zon. maps
30.43C.040 27.12.040(4) No liability
Deleted 27.16.010 Administration

84

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.43C.020 27.16.020; FH Permit procedure
27.16.030
30.43C.030 27.16.040 Additional submittal reqts.
30.43C.100 27.16.050, Decision criteria-FH permit
27.12.040(2)

30.43C.200 27.16.055 Permit expiration

30.65.100 27.16.060 floodproofing-use of available
data

30.86.300 27.16.070 Special flood hazard areas
permit fees

Deleted 27.16.080 Appeals-procedure Covered by procedures Ch. 30.71

30.65.130 27.20.010 Elev & fldproof cert

30.65.140 27.20.020 Certification form

30.65.150 27.20.030 Info to be obtained

30.65.160 27.20.040 Certif responsibility

30.65.110 27.24.010 Floodproofing-Gen stds

30.65.120 27.24.020 Floodproofing-Spec stds

30.65.200 27.28.010 Fldwy fringe areas-permitted
uses

30.65.210 27.28.020 Fldwy fringe areas-prohibited
uses

30.65.220 27.32.010 Fldwys-permitted uses

30.65.230 27.32.020 Fldwys-prohibited uses

30.65.240(1) & [27.36.010; Density fringe areas; Area of

(2) 27.36.020 coverage

30.65.250 27.36.030 Density fringe area-Max
allowable density

30.65.255 27.36.040 Density fringe area-Max

allowable obstruction

85

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.65.260 27.36.050 Density fringe area-Excptns
t/max d & o limits
30.65.270 27.36.060 Density fringe area-Gen
provisions
30.65.280 27.36.070 Density fringe area-Permitted
uses
30.65.285 27.36.080 Density fringe area-Prohibited
uses
30.65.300 27.40.010 Continuation of
nonconforming uses and
structures
30.65.310 27.40.020 Nonconforming uses
30.65.320 27.40.030 Discontinuance
30.65.330 27.40.040 Restoration
30.65.340 27.40.050 Nonconforming structures
30.43D.020 27.44.010, FHA variance procedure
27.44.035
Deleted 27.44.015 Notice of app/comment Covered by procedures Ch. 30.70 and 30.71
period
30.43D.015 27.44.020 Variance limitations
30.43D.100 27.44.030 Decision criteria-FHA
variance
30.43D.110 27.44.040 Addn’l notification reqgs
Deleted 27.44.045 Appeals Replaced by standard appeal process in Ch. 30.71
Deleted 27.48.010 Director's authority Covered by Ch. 30.85
Deleted 27.48.020 Applicable Covered by Ch. 30.85
Deleted 27.48.030 Order to cease violation Covered by Ch. 30.85
Deleted 27.48.040 Notice o/viol-penalty/abate Covered by Ch. 30.85
Deleted 27.48.050 Public nuisance Covered by Ch. 30.85
Deleted 27.48.060 Alternative remedies Covered by Ch. 30.85

86

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 27.48.070 Admin jurisdiction-nonexclusv |Covered by Ch. 30.85
30.85.030 28.04.040 Right of entry
30.85.010 28.08.010 Purpose & applicability
Deleted 28.08.020(1) Enforcement tech review
comm
30.91N.100 28.08.020(4) Nuisance
30.91N.110 28.08.020(5) Nuisance, public
Deleted 28.08.020(6) Land use ordinance
30.91P.140 28.08.020(7) Permit
30.85.120 28.08.030 Declaration of public nuisance
30.85.320 28.08.050, Abatement
28.08.060
Deleted 28.08.070 Tech review committee
30.85.325 28.08.080 Misdemeanor
1 30.85.260 28.08.100, Civil penalty schedule Eliminating triple penalties; retaining double penalties for all
28.08.110 repeat violations.
30.85.100 28.12.010 Initiation
30.85.135 28.12.040 Service Adding specific requirements for each type of order or notice to
1 comply with case laws. Allows posting in right-of-way when
access to property is not available.
30.85.125 28.12.050 Voluntary correction New process for requesting voluntary correction of violations.
3 Avoids immediate notice and order. Allows voluntary agreement
and provides for enforcement.
5 30.85.230 28.12.055 Failure to appeal notice and |Director may request hearing for imposition of monetary
order penalties.
5 30.85.200 28.12.065, Appeal of notice and order Eliminating fee for appeal of notice and order. Allowing appeal
2.02.125 by mail
30.85.250 28.12.080 Final order - enforcement
30.85.115 28.16.010 Suspension

87

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.85.122 28.16.010(3) Emergency order
30.85.300 28.20.010, Liens - generally
28.20.020,
28.20.040
30.85.310 28.20.050, Liens - filing and recording
28.20.060
30.85.315 28.20.080 Liens - foreclosure
Deleted 28.24.010 Declared
30.41E.010 29.02.010 Purpose and applicability
Deleted 29.04.010 General
5 30.41A.235 29.04.025 Design standards - building |Resolve inconsistency by applying newer BLA std. for building
area area; standard was implied but not specific. 2000 sf required.
Deleted 29.04.025 Building Moved this requirement to text in 30.41A, B, & E.
30.91L.160 29.04.070 Lot Footprint
30.41E.020 29.08.010 Procedure & special timing
requirements
30.86.140 29.12.010 Boundary line adjustment
30.41E.300 29.12.010(2)(f)  |Future develop approval
30.41E.200 29.12.010(3) Design stds-access
Deleted 29.12.015 Notice Covered in Ch. 30.70 and 30.71
30.41E.100 29.12.020 Decision criteria
Deleted 29.16.010 Decision
Deleted 29.16.020 Appeals-procedure Covered in Ch. 30.71
30.41E.400 29.20.040 Recording
Deleted 29.22.010 Purpose
30.41E.410 29.22.020 Correcting errors on an
approved BLA
30.73.010 32.05.010; Purpose & applicability Legislative decisions. Describing legislative matters covered by
1 32.05.015 chapter. Noting that initiative and referenda processes are

exempt from the chapter.

88

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 32.05.015 Applicability

30.73.045 32.05.020(1) Planning commission hearing

Deleted 32.05.020(1) Procedures-plan comm
consid

30.73.070 32.05.020(2) Council consideration

30.73.080 32.05.020(2)(c) |Council actions

30.73.090 32.05.023 Emergency adoption
procedures

30.73.110 32.05.025 Additional public participation

30.73.120 32.05.030 Compliance with Type 3
procedures

30.74.010 32.07.010; Purpose and applicability

32.07.020

30.74.020 32.07.030 Submittal requirements

30.74.030 32.07.040 Init review & evaluation

30.74.040 32.07.050 Initial review of rezone
requests

30.74.050 32.07.060 Council approval of final
docket

30.74.060 32.07.080 Processing of final docket

30.74.080 32.07.090 Timing for submittal of
proposals

30.74.070 32.07.120 Cost of environmental studies

30.74.090 32.07.130 Violation not grounds for
invalidation

30.29.010 32.08.100 Purpose

30.29.020 32.08.105 Intent

Deleted 32.08.110 Defs specific to chapter

Deleted 32.08.110(1) Director

89

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 32.08.110(2) District, health See also SCC 30.62.500(4)
1 [30.91S.170 32.08.110(4) Sewer, public Changed to match the WAC at 246-272-01001
30.91U.070 32.08.110(5) Unsewered urban enclave
Deleted 32.08.110(6) UGA
30.91P.370 32.08.110(7) Public facility For sewer connections regulations
30.91P.390 32.08.110(7) Public facilities necessary to
support development
30.29.100 32.08.120 New struct. & land divi. w/in
UGA
Deleted 32.08.130 Adm. rules - auth. to promulg.
30.29.110 32.08.140 Pub sewer connection
prohibited
30.29.120 32.08.160 Pub sewage system
construction
30.62. 32.10. Critical areas regulations
Deleted 32.10.010 Authority
30.62.010 32.10.020 Purpose & applicability
Deleted 32.10.030 Applicability
30.62.020 32.10.050 Compliance w/o laws
30.62.030 32.10.060 Relationship-chap 30.61 SCC
Deleted 32.10.080 Private property rights Covered by 30.10.090
Deleted 32.10.090 Severability
30.91A.170 32.10.110(1) Anadromous fish
30.91D.240 32.10.110(11) Development activity
30.91E.160 32.10.110(13) Erosion hazard areas
30.91E.200 32.10.110(14) Estuarine wetland
Deleted 32.10.110(15) Existing legal lot
30.91F.320 32.10.110(16) Fish & wildlife hab

conservation area

90

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91F.530 32.10.110(17) Functions and values
30.91G.020 32.10.110(18) Geologic hazard areas
30.91G.030 32.10.110(19) Geologist
30.91H.010 32.10.110(21) Habitat enhancement
30.91H.040 32.10.110(22) Hazardous trees
30.91H.270 32.10.110(23) Hydrologically connected
30.91L.030 32.10.110(24) Landslide
30.91L.040 32.10.110(25) Landslide hazard areas
30.91M.050 32.10.110(26) Mature forested wetland
30.91M.090 32.10.110(27) Mine hazard areas
30.91M.120 32.10.110(28) Mitigation
30.91N.010 32.10.110(29) Native growth protection

areas
30.91B.090 32.10.110(3) Best management practices,
critical areas
Deleted 32.10.110(30) Ordinary high water See ordinary high water mark
30.910.040 32.10.110(31) Ordinary residential
improvements
30.91P.290 32.10.110(32) Primary association
30.91R.210 32.10.110(34) Riparian wetlands
30.91S.010 32.10.110(35) Salmonid
30.91S.120 32.10.110(36) Seismic hazard areas
30.91S.350 32.10.110(37) Site, critical areas
30.91B.170 32.10.110(4) Bog/fen system
30.91S.740 32.10.110(41) Subject property
30.91S.770 32.10.110(42) Surface water connection
30.91S.390 32.10.110(43) Toe of slope
30.91S.400 32.10.110(44) Top of slope
Deleted 32.10.110(45) Uniform building code
30.91U.120 32.10.110(46) Utility corridor

91

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91V.030 32.10.110(48) Volcanic hazard areas
30.91W.050 32.10.110(49) Wetland class
Deleted 32.10.110(5) Bond See also SCC 30.66C.410(20)
30.91W.060 32.10.110(50) Wetlands
30.91B.190 32.10.110(6) Buffer
30.91C.340 32.10.110(7) Critical areas
30.91C.350 32.10.110(8) Critical area study
30.91C.370 32.10.110(9) Critical species
30.62.040 32.10.210 Designat of critical areas
30.62.050 32.10.220 Preapp conf encouraged
30.62.060 32.10.220 Time period for rvw
30.62.055 32.10.230 Additional submittal reqts.
Deleted 32.10.235 Time period f/review
30.62.075 32.10.240 Permnt protec f/crit area
30.62.070 32.10.260 Bond or perform security
Deleted 32.10.270 Adm rules policies & procedr |[Covered by Ch. 30.82
Deleted 32.10.280 Fees See Ch. 30.86
Deleted 32.10.290 (1) Violations and enfrcmnt Covered by Ch. 30.85
30.62.080 32.10.295 Open space taxation
30.62.100 32.10.310 Protect for f/w habitat...
30.62.110 32.10.320 Habitat managemnt plan
30.62.200 32.10.410 Erosion hazard areas
30.62.210 32.10.420 Landslide hazard areas
30.62.220 32.10.430 Seismic hazard areas
30.62.230 32.10.440 Mine hazard areas
30.62.240 32.10.450 Geotech reprt cont regs
30.62.250 32.10.460 Volcanic hazard areas
30.62.300 32.10.510 Classification of streams &

wetlands

92

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank

UDC Sec #

Exist Sec #

UDC Section Title

Notes

30.62.300(1) &
Table

32.10.510(1)

Stream classifications and
Water typing criteria

30.62.300(2) &
Table

32.10.510(2)

Wetlands categories; Cat. 4
Wetlands: Inv./exotic plant
species

30.62.310 32.10.520 Std buffer width reqgs
30.62.320 32.10.530 Perm Protect -strms, wtinds,
buffers
30.62.330 32.10.540 Sngl fam res-exist Igl lots
30.62.340 32.10.550 CA stdy reg-strms/wtinds
1 30.62.345 32.10.560 Mitigation plan reqs (6) clarifying current practice and code allowing small wetlands
to be dealt with through drainage plan and BMPs.
30.62.350 32.10.570 Allowed dev act in
strms/wtlnds & buffers
30.62.360 32.10.575 Activities allowed pursuant to
BMPs
30.62.365 32.10.580 Revw crit for stream, wetland
or buffer activ...
30.62.370 32.10.590 Innov dev design Removed requirement for state approval of innovative design
2 solutions prior to county approval. (No effect on state jurisdiction
over its own permits).
30.62.375 32.10.595 Wetland mitigat banking
30.62.400 32.10.610 Reasonable use allow...
30.64.020 32.11.010 Review for groundwater
impacts
30.64.030 32.11.020 Doc & mitigation plan
30.64.040 32.11.030, Hydrogeologic site evaluation
32.11.050(7)
30.64.050 32.11.040 Imposition of conditions on

projects

93

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
Deleted 32.11.050 Definitions
1 [30.91A.260 32.11.050(1) Aquifer Revised to match the WAC
Deleted 32.11.050(10) Potable water See also SCC 30.63.500(20)
Deleted 32.11.050(11) Remediation
Deleted 32.11.050(12) Requirements (water quality)
30.91S.490 32.11.050(13) Sole source aquifer
Deleted 32.11.050(14) Standards (groundwater)
30.91S.760 32.11.050(15) Surface water
Deleted 32.11.050(16) Vulnerability
Deleted 32.11.050(17) Wellhead protection area
30.91B.010 32.11.050(2) Background water quality
30.91B.100 32.11.050(3) Best management practice
program
30.91C.290 32.11.050(4) Contaminant
30.91G.100 32.11.050(5) Groundwater
30.91G.110 32.11.050(6) Groundwater management
Deleted 32.11.050(7) Hydrogeologic site evaluation
30.91H.250 32.11.050(8) Hydrogeology
Deleted 32.11.050(9) Interim development See “Hazard areas, volcanic”
regulation
30.64.010 32.11.060 Purpose and Applicabil... Groundwater protection
30.32A.010 32.13 Purpose and applicability
Deleted 32.13.010 Definitions
30.91C.150 32.13.010(1) Commercial forest
30.91F.460 32.13.010(2) Forest lands
30.91F.490 32.13.010(3) Forest transition area
30.32A.020 32.13.010(4) Resource protection area
30.32A.100 32.13.020 Subdivision restrictions

94

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

30.32A.110 32.13.030 Siting of new structures: local
forest land or adj to forest land

30.32A.120 32.13.040 Siting of new structures: com
forest

30.32A.020 32.13.050 Resource protection areas

30.32B 32.14, 32.15 Agricultural Lands

Deleted 32.14.005 Definitions

30.91F.140 32.14.005(1) Farmland, designated

30.32B.020 32.14.005(2) Resource protection area

30.32B.100 32.14.010 Prohibited uses: riverway and
upland comm. farmland

30.32B.110 32.14.020 Subdivision/short sub
restrictions-upland comm.
farmland

30.32B.120 32.14.030; Subdiv/short sub restrict in

32.14.040 local comm. farmland

30.32B.130 32.14.050 Setbacks for new dwellings

30.32B.020 32.14.055 Resource protect areas

30.32B.140 32.14.070 Road & utility limits

Deleted 32.14.087 Stdy feas o/trsfr/pur o/dev
rights

30.32B.010 32.15.010 Purpose and applicability

30.63A.030 32.15.010 Right to farm

Deleted 32.15.020 Definitions

30.91A.020 32.15.020(1) Acceptable agricultural
practices

30.91A.090 32.15.020(2) Agricultural activities

30.91A.100 32.15.020(3) Agricultural land

Deleted 32.15.020(4) Building permit

95

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes

Deleted 32.15.020(5) Designated farmland
Deleted 32.15.020(6) Development permit See also SCC 30.66A.200(19)
30.91F.120 32.15.020(7) Farm
30.91F.150 32.15.020(8) Farm product
Deleted 32.15.020(9) Person See 30.91P.160
30.32B.200 32.15.030 Ag activities-Presumed

reasonable, not nuisance

1 |30.32B.210 32.15.040 Notice & disclosure required

30.32B.220 32.15.050 Disclosure text
Deleted 32.15.060 Severability
30.32C.010 32.16.010 Purpose and applicability Cross reference to MC zoning @ 30.31D.
Deleted 32.16.020 Definitions
30.91M.100 32.16.020(1) Mineral resource land,

designated
Deleted 32.16.020(2) Building permit
Deleted 32.16.020(3) Development permit
30.91E.170 32.16.020(4) Established mine
30.32C.200 32.16.030 Notice and disclosure Req'd |Deleted requirement for planning commission report to council

(due December 2000).

30.32C.210 32.16.040 Disclosure text
Deleted 32.16.050 Severability
Deleted 32.20 Right To Practice Forestry
Deleted 32.20.020(1) Forest land, designated See also SCC 30.44.630
30.91F.470 32.20.020(2) Forest management activities
Deleted 32.20.020(3) Building permit
Deleted 32.20.020(4) Development permit
Deleted 32.20.020(5) Person See 30.91P.160
30.32A.200 32.20.030 Forest mgmt activities-

reasonable & not nuisance

96

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 30.32A.210 32.20.040 Notice & disclosure required |Deleted seven year reporting requirement (planning commission
report to council).
30.32A.220 32.20.050 Disclosure text
30.32A.030 32.20.060 Exemption from special
benefit assessments
Deleted 32.20.070 Severability
30.41C 32.30 Rural Cluster Subdivision and
short subdivisions
30.41C.010 32.30.010 Purpose
30.91N.020 32.30.013 Natural resource area
Deleted 32.30.014 NGPA See 30.91N.010
Deleted 32.30.015 Open Space
30.91R.130 32.30.016 Restricted open space
30.91R.270 32.30.017 Rural Cluster subdivision
30.91R.280 32.30.018, Rural/urban transition area
18.90.727
30.91U.060 32.30.019 Unbuildable land
30.41C.020 32.30.020 Applicability
30.41C.030 32.30.025 Approval procedure
30.41C.040 32.30.030 Addn’l Submittal req.
30.41C.200 32.30.040 Design stds-general
30.41C.210 32.30.050 Design stds - restricted open
space - bulk regulations
30.41C.300 32.30.050(4)-(6) |Ownership & Preserv. of Res
Op Sp.
30.41C.220 32.30.053 Rural/urban trans. Areas-open
space and bulk reqgs
30.41C.230 32.30.055 Design stds: Lot yield
30.41C.240 32.30.060 Design stds: Bonus

residential density

97

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.41C.310 32.30.070 Form of public dedication
1 Deleted 32.30.075 Planning commission review |Requirement for quarterly report on Rural Cluster Subdivisions
not used
Deleted 32.30.080 Severability
30.33B.010 32.35.010 Purpose
30.33B.020 32.35.020 Applicability
30.33B.030 32.35.030 Review of Apps in GPOs
30.70.010 32.50.010; Purpose & applicability
32.50.020
30.91P.350 32.50.030(1) Project permit
Deleted 32.50.030(3) Department
1 30.70.040 32.50.040 Completeness determin Same timeline (28 days); e-mail may be used for completeness
determination.
30.70.045 32.50.060 Notice - general
30.70.060 32.50.060 Public and agency comment
period
30.70.070 32.50.060 Adequacy of mailed notice
1 30.73.050 32.50.060; Planning commission hearing |Clarifying the PC may recommend denial of an ordinance.
32.05.020 notice
30.72.030 32.50.060; Notice and timing of open
32.50.110(4) record hearing
30.70.080 32.50.080 Combined notice
1 30.70.090 32.50.090 Combined hearings Clarifying that combined hearings must still be conducted within
geographic boundary of the county.
30.70.100 32.50.100 Consistency determination
5 30.70.110 32.50.110 Timelines Added exception for time spent on code interpretations and
development agreements.
30.70.120 32.50.120 Consolidated permit review
2 130.71.040 32.50.130(1), (3) [Type 1 Notice of decision Notice of all Type decisions to be published.

98

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 30.70.015 32.50.140 Exemptions All projects with public notice requirements now covered by one
section/chapter, rather than spread throughout code.
30.33A.010 33.01.010 Purpose & applicability
30.33A.020 33.07.010 Creation of county register
30.33A.030 33.07.020 Designation of property on Clarifying who may nominate; PDS to provide a written
5 county register recommendation to commission; clarifying responsibility and
method for public notice. Adds requirement for notice of
decision.
30.33A.040 33.07.030 Criteria for designation
1 |30.33A.050 33.07.040 Removal from county register |Clarifying notice requirements
30.33A.060 33.07.050 Alteration or demolition of
property on county register
5 30.33A.070 33.09.010 Procedure for obtaining Commission required to consider requests to alter or demolish
certificate or waiver at a public meeting.
1 30.33A.075 33.09.020 Exemptions Definition of "ordinary repair and maintenance" and "emergency
repair” included in text.
30.33A.080 33.09.030 Review process for certificate
of appropriateness
30.33A.090 33.09.050 Review process for waiver Considering alternatives to demolition; formerly included in the
definition of "waiver” (33.03) moved here to text.
30.33A.100 33.15.010 Applicability of zoning
requirements
30.33A.200 33.17.010 Archaeology site report
30.33A.210 33.17.020 Project or permit approval on
archaeological resource
properties
30.33A.220 33.17.030 Human remains or Specifically authorizing a stop work order. Clarifying process
archaeological resources and authority for designating a preservation area.
found on a site
30.33A.300 33.17.040 Appeals Clarifying appeal process as standard for Type 1 decisions.

99

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 [30.10.010 New Title Naming new title
1 [30.10.020 New Purpose General purpose statement
1 [30.10.030 New Authority Stating existing authority for code
1 30.10.050 New County-wide and multi-county |Reference to adoption of CPPs and participation in multi-county
planning policies planning policies.
1 [30.10.060 New Comprehensive Plan Reference to comprehensive plan and amending ordinances.
30.10.070 New Relationship of Reference to use of prior subarea plans as set forth in
1 comprehensive plan to comprehensive plan.
previously adopted plans
1 30.10.080 New GMA development regulations | Clarifying which chapters are GMA development regulations.
1 130.10.090 New Protection of private property |Confirming that the UDC meets the required takings analysis.
1 30.21.020 New Establishment of zones Establishes Table 30.21.020(1)-Snohomish County Zones by
Category.
1 [30.23.040(27) New Height limit exceptions Cross referencing existing section
1 30.23.040(28) New Additional stbk regs and Cross referencing existing section
exceptions
1 30.23.040(29) New Additional lot area reqs and | Cross referencing existing section
exceptions
1 30.23.040(30) New Siting new structures-c forest |Cross referencing existing section
land
1 30.23.040(31) New MC zone perf stds and min Cross referencing existing section
zon crit
1 30.23.040(32) New MC zone-contig geographic  |Cross referencing existing section
area
1 130.23.040(33) New H O structures-setback reqs | Cross referencing existing section
1 [30.23.040(34) New Min lot area reqgs Cross referencing existing section
1 ]30.23.040(35) New Townhouse zone bulk reg Cross referencing existing section
1 [30.23.040(36) New MR/LDMR setbacks Cross referencing existing section

100

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 30.23.040(44) New Figure on easement setbacks |lllustration.
1 30.24.010 New Road and access standards |Restating authority from title 26B as a regular development
requirement.
30.31B.010 New Purpose & applicability
2 [30.31B.310 New Revocation of approval Matching provisions for BP zones and CUPs.
30.31F.300 New Revisions Allowing revisions as in other perf. std. zones. Determination of
1 whether a revision is major or minor to be made through code
interpretation process.
5 30.31F.310 New Review or revocation of Matching provisions for BP zones and CUPs.
approval
2 |[30.41A.700 New Subdivision alteration New procedure and stds for subdivision alteration.
30.41A.710 New Application for subdivision See note @30.41A.700
alteration
30.41A.720 New Procedure for subdivision See note @30.41A.700
alteration
30.41A.730 New Special notice requirements |See note @30.41A.700
30.41A.740 New Decision criteria See note @30.41A.700
30.41A.750 New Final subdivision alteration See note @30.41A.700
process & recording
2 130.41B.700 New Short subdiv alterations Alteration through Type 1 process added.
5 30.42A.140 New Review and revocation Providing consistent reference to review and revocation
procedure in chapter 30.71.
30.42E.020 New MHP-procedure
2 |30.42E.120 New Revisions Allowing revisions to an approved official site plan.
1 |30.42E.130 New Review or revocation Providing consistent reference to revocation procedures.
1 30.50.010 New Purpose and applicability General provisions for and defining the construction codes.
These are non-GMA codes.
1 [30.54B.050 New Other sign regulations Provides cross reference to chapter 30.27 SCC.

101

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
1 30.70.065 New Computing time periods for | Clarifying when notice and appeal periods start and end.
public comment and appeals
30.70.130 New Authority to impose conditions | Expressly stating authority to impose conditions, as implied
2 or deny application throughout existing code.
1 |30.71.010 New Purpose & applicability Describing Type 1 administrative decisions
1 [30.71.020 New Type 1 permits & decisions Listing Type 1 decisions
1 |30.71.030 New Type 1 process overview Overview of process
1 30.71.045 New Effect of decision Clarifying that decision is not final (no action may be taken) until
appeal period has expired.
30.71.072 New Transfer of files
1 [30.72.010 New Purpose & applicability Describing Type 2 hearing examiner decisions
1 30.72.020 New Type 2 permits and decisions. |Listing Type 2 decisions
1 [30.72.025 New Type 2 process overview Overview
2 130.72.125 New Effect of remand Clarifying remand effect and process; council to specify.
30.73.020 New Overview of Type 3 legislative
process
1 [30.73.040 New Report of Department Existing practice clarified.
30.73.085 New Limitation on comprehensive
amendments
30.73.100 New Appeal of a Type 3 action
5 30.75.010 New Purpose & applicability New process for development agreements taken from state
statute, RCW 36.70B.170-.210
30.75.020 New Procedure: development See note at 30.75.010
agreements
30.75.100 New Decision criteria See note at 30.75.010
30.75.200 New Recording required See note at 30.75.010
30.75.210 New Modification of development |See note at 30.75.010
agreement

102 09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.75.300 New Appeal of development See note at 30.75.010
agreement
30.82.020 New Format of rule See note at 30.82.010
30.82.030 New Notice of proposed rule See note at 30.82.010
30.82.040 New Approval of rule See note at 30.82.010
30.82.050 New Emergency rule See note at 30.82.010
30.82.060 New Effect of rule See note at 30.82.010
30.82.070 New Pre-existing policies, See note at 30.82.010
procedures, and rules
30.82.080 New Public inspection of rules See note at 30.82.010
30.83.020 New Request for code See note at 30.83.010
interpretation
30.83.030 New Interpretation procedure See note at 30.83.010
30.83.040 New Code interpretations specific |See note at 30.83.010
to project
30.83.050 New Code interpretation - decision |See note at 30.83.010
of the director
30.83.060 New Appeal See note at 30.83.010
30.84.040 New Easement or license to Allowing county access to properties covered by security device.
1 inspect and make
improvements
1 130.84.080 New Reimbursement of costs Clarifying process for use of security and reimbursement.
1 [30.84.100 New Additional remedies Clarifying authority to seek additional remedies.
1 130.85.020 New Violations Defining what constitutes a violation.
1 30.85.205 New Transmittal of files Establishing deadline for transmittal of file to Hearing Examiner.
30.85.220 New Failure to appear Failure to appear at appeal hearing results in default-type order.
2 Order may be set aside by hearing examiner for good cause.

103

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE

(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.85.240 New Failure to comply with Failure to comply with a VCA may result in monetary penalties.
2 voluntary correction
agreement
1 30.85.245 New Notice and procedure for From 2.02.125: standard requests for notice and hearing.
penalty hearings
30.86.015 New Fee refunds
30.86.120 New Rural cluster subdivision fees |Referencing regular fees for subdivision or short subdivision
30.86.530 New Park & rec imp mit fees
30.86.540 New Road impact mitigation fees
30.86.550 New School impact mitigation fees
30.86.600 New Permit decision appeal fees
30.86.610 New Code interpretation
30.90.010 New Applicability
30.90.020 New Uniform code definitions
30.90.030 New Amendment of definitions
chapters...
30.90.040 New Multiple definitions of same
term
1 |30.91C.270 New Construction contracting In Use Matrix, 30.22.100, 30.22.110.
1 [30.91C.320 New County engineer
1 [30.91D.300 New DNS
1 [30.91D.470 New DS
1 [30.91E.080 New EIS
1 |30.91E.210 New Et seq.
1 [30.91F.170 New Farm stand
1 [30.91F.340 New Five (5) acres
1 [30.91G.070 New Grade
30.91P.150 New Building permit
1 |30.91P.170 New Person responsible

104

09/11/2002




UDC/SCC SECTION CITATION COMPARISON TABLE
(Sorted by Existing SCC Code #)

Rank|UDC Sec # Exist Sec # UDC Section Title Notes
30.91P.210 New Planned Residential
Development (PRD)

1 |30.91P.380 New Public facilities

1 |30.91S.030 New School, college

1 [30.917.030 New Zoning
Deleted New Resource protection area
Deleted New Utility facility, small

1 [30.84.060 New Emergency work by county Allowing use of security to fund emergency work.
30.41A Title 19 Subdivisions
30.41B Title 20 Short Subdivisions
30.43C.010 Title 27 Purpose and applicability
30.43D.010 Title 27 Purpose and applicability
30.41E Title 29 Boundary line adjustments
30.33A Historic Preservation
30.33B.040 Sunset clause code reviser note; no existing section
30.41B.500 RESERVED
30.42D Essential Public Facilities RESERVED; no existing section

105

09/11/2002




